23/11/2021, 14:38 Gmail - Fwd: Request for offer

M Gma” Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Fwd: Request for offer

8 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Nov 23, 2021 at 9:32 AM

To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>
Cc: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Neoprn BositHoB <amelideood@abv.bg>
Date: Tue, 23 Nov 2021 at 09:31

Subject: Request for offer

To: <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hello dear colleagues

From now on all my orders will be from company
INVERSA LTD.

BG204956745

18 Haidushka gora str. Sofia

Owner: Atanas Lazarov

This is our trade company
AMELID EOOD will be only for service.

Will | get same prices and payment methods with our new company?
Also | want to order

Part number: 0110072 - R-22Vi - 8 pieces
Part number: 0110023 - R-23V - 6 pieces

AMELID LTD
Bulgaria, Sofia 1614
35 Madzharica str.

+359887370730

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Nov 23, 2021 at 9:41 AM

Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=77e4056450&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1717210969882827939&simpl=msg-f%3A171721...
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