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M Gma” Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
order Gidive Store

1 message

Gidive Store <info@gidivestore.com> 23 November 2021 at 08:52

To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello Gail,

Please, take this as our updated order:

1 x 0110238 Vandagraph R-22AT Oxygen Sensor for Analox ATA

5x7910201 Vandagraph Tek-Ox Oxygen Analyzer

1x 0110224 Vandagraph Sensor Oxigeno R-33DE para Analox O2ElI
Is it possible to ship one tek-ox analyzer to this address by courier?

Radu Popovici

33, Ferdinand Str, BI.R7, Sc. B, Apt.7
900654 Constanta

Romania

+40744587515

Muchas gracias de nuevo
Saludos cordiales

Toni Ferrer

GIDIVESTORE

EVERYTHIHG FOR DIVING

Gidive Sports, SL
C/ President Macia, 70 | 17230 - Palamés (Girona)

Tel.: +34 872 21 64 53 | www.gidivestore.com
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De: Gidive Store [mailto:info@gidivestore.com]
Enviado el: lunes, 22 de noviembre de 2021 18:21
Para: 'gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk’

Asunto: RE: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN133261-1

HELLO Gail,

| hope you are fine.

Please, find below our new order. Would be possible to ship one analyzer direcltly to the customer in Romania?

5x7910201 Vandagraph Tek-Ox Oxygen Analyzer

1x 0110224 Vandagraph Sensor Oxigeno R-33DE para Analox O2ElI

Muchas gracias de nuevo
Saludos cordiales

Toni Ferrer

GIDIVESTORE

EYERYTHING FOR DIVING

Gidive Sports, SL
C/ President Macia, 70 | 17230 - Palamés (Girona)

Tel.: +34 872 21 64 53 | www.gidivestore.com

!}n ]

De: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] En nombre de Gail Bell
Enviado el: lunes, 22 de noviembre de 2021 10:53

Para: Gidive Store

Asunto: Re: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN133261-1
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Good morning,

Please find attached TAN130064-1 as requested.

Kind regards

Gail Bell
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900

On Mon, 22 Nov 2021 at 09:49, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Fri, 19 Nov 2021 at 15:46

Subject: Fwd: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN133261-1
To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Gidive Store <info@gidivestore.com>

Date: Fri, 19 Nov 2021 at 15:45

Subject: RE: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN133261-1
To: <accounts@vandagraph.co.uk>

Hello, please, could you send me this document?

TAN130064-1

Muchas gracias de nuevo
Saludos cordiales
Toni Ferrer

Gidive Sports, SL
C/ President Macia, 70 | 17230 - Palamos (Girona)
Tel.: +34 872 21 64 53 | www.gidivestore.com

————— Mensaje original-----

De: accounts@vandagraph.co.uk [mailto:accounts@vandagraph.co.uk]
Enviado el: jueves, 14 de octubre de 2021 16:18

Para: info@gidivestore.com

Asunto: Vandagraph Ltd. Invoice(s) RAN133261-1

Please find attached invoice(s) from Vandagraph Ltd.

Should you have any queries please do not hesitate in contacting us.
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk

Regards

Accounts Department
Vandagraph Ltd
accounts@vandagraph.co.uk

Please do not reply to this Email as it is unmonitored.
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