22/11/2021, 08:31 Gmail - RE: Official Purchase Order from George Eliot Hospital NHS Trust: GE210028946

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: Official Purchase Order from George Eliot Hospital NHS Trust: GE210028946

1 message

Generic Mailbox GEH - Purchasing <Purchasing@geh.nhs.uk> 22 November 2021 at 01:49
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "Williams Sophie (RLT) Secretary - Maternity Services GEH" <sophie.wiliams@geh.nhs.uk>

Good morning,

| have amended the purchase order to reflect the price below. | can confirm we are happy to proceed.. Do you
need an amended PO sending over?

Kind Regards,

Sophie Hood.

(my pronouns are she/her)

M: 07392 194720

| am also available on teams.

My working days are Monday and Friday 9-5. For queries outside of these days / hours please contact
purchasing@geh.nhs.uk

No PO No Pay will be implemented from 2022

Please ensure official Purchase Order Numbers are raised appropriately and quoted on all invoices.

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: 19 November 2021 16:16

To: Williams Sophie (RLT) Secretary - Maternity Services GEH; Generic Mailbox GEH - Purchasing
Subject: Re: Official Purchase Order from George Eliot Hospital NHS Trust: GE210028946

Good afternoon,
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Thank you for your order E210028946. Please could | inform you that the prices for EyeMax are as follows:

1114005 - EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Regular Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 32 - 38 cm. Pack of 20
=£43.70

1114006 - EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Premie Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 26 - 32 cm. Pack of 20
= £41.90

1114007 - EyeMax 2 Neonatal Phototherapy Mask Micro Occipital - Frontal Circumference: 20 - 26 cm. Pack of
20 =£37.80

UK postage charges:

1 pack: £6.00
2 - 4 packs: £8.00
5 packs or more: £10.00

Please let me know if you would like us to proceed.

Please could | also advise you that part number 1114006 has a lead time of approximately 4-5 weeks. We will of
course ship as soon as stock becomes available.

| apologise if this causes any inconvenience.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Fri, 19 Nov 2021 at 16:08, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <purchasing@geh.nhs.uk>

Date: Fri, 19 Nov 2021 at 16:05

Subject: Official Purchase Order from George Eliot Hospital NHS Trust: GE210028946
To: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <sophie.williams@geh.nhs.uk>, <Sophie.Hood@geh.nhs.uk>

Please find attached a Purchase Order from George Eliot Hospital NHS Trust for goods/services to be provided by
VIAMED.

Please view the attachment for details of the goods/services required.

*k%k

*** Integra Workflow
*** [XMLOO01]
*** Purchase Order

*k%k

DISCLAIMER: This e-mail, and any files transmitted with it, are confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual to whom it is addressed. If you are not the intended recipient please destroy this message, delete any
copies held on your systems, and notify the sender immediately. You should not retain copy or use this e-mail for any
purpose, nor disclose all or any part of its content to any other person.
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