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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

RE: New PO 1067771

1 message

Karin Jensen <karin.jensen@dameca.com> 17 November 2021 at 05:52
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk" <ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk>

Goodmorning Kate

 

Yes I am happy to proceed with 34,5 each. For some reason my PO created a small discount
– sorry

 

/Karin

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of
Kate Griffiths

Sent: 16. november 2021 14:44

To: Karin Jensen <karin.jensen@dameca.com>

Cc: ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk

Subject: Re: New PO 1067771

 

Good afternoon Karin,

 

Thank you for your orders - one for December, one for January.

 

Please could I advise you that correct price is $34.50 each?  Please let me know if you are happy to proceed.

 

Many thanks.

Kind regards

 

Kate Griffiths

 

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where
possible.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Mon, 15 Nov 2021 at 12:38, Karin Jensen <karin.jensen@dameca.com> wrote:



______________________________

E-mail automatically created by the free PDFCreator
www.pdfforge.org





Best regards,



Karin Jensen

Purchaser



Dameca A/S

Islevdalvej 211, DK-2610 Roedovre

Tel: +45 44 50 99 14 - Mobile: +45 26 87 90 65

Email: Karin.jensen@dameca.com

www.dameca.com





Dameca A/S develops, manufactures and sells innovative anesthesia machines to the world market and is found in
more than 100 countries. Our product portfolio also includes flow meters, suction units, wall panels and other
OR/ICU and ward supplies. Dameca is
a company of the Löwenstein Group.



The information contained in this message may be confidential and legally protected under applicable law. The
message is intended solely for the addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that
any use, forwarding, dissemination,
or reproduction of this message is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If
you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by return e-mail and destroy all copies of the original
message.
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