16/11/2021, 14:47 Gmail - RE: Purchase Order Number: 125000

M Gma“ Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
RE: Purchase Order Number: 125000

1 message

Orders <Orders@chrystalconsulting.co.uk> 16 November 2021 at 14:41

To: "sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk" <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

Good afternoon,
We are happy to proceed.
Kind regards,

Dylan McDowell

Admin assistant

( CHRYSTAL
‘ MEDICAL

Chrystal Medical, 500 Styal Road, Manchester, M22 5HQ
Office: 0161493 9770

dylan@chrystalconsulting.co.uk

www.chrystalmedical.co.uk
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sophie Lines
Sent: 16 November 2021 14:01

To: Orders <Orders@chrystalconsulting.co.uk>

Subject: Re: Purchase Order Number: 125000

Good afternoon,

Thank you for your order 125000 - please be aware there is a £10.00 plus VAT carriage charge applicable on this
order - please can you confirm whether you are happy for us to proceed?

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and
may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44
(0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, Nov 16, 2021 at 1:13 PM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <Chrystal_Consulting@ingenicasolutions.com>
Date: Tue, 16 Nov 2021 at 13:09

Subject: Purchase Order Number: 125000

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

FAO: Viamed Ltd
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Please find attached our Purchase Order Number: 125000.

This is an automated email that cannot accept replies.
Please contact

orders@chrystalconsulting.co.uk with any order queries and order confirmation.

Please send all invoices and statements to

finance@chrystalconsulting.co.uk

Kind regards

Chrystal Consulting Limited
500 Styal Road

Manchester

M22 5HQ

Office 0161 493 9770
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