16/11/2021, 09:40 Gmail - Re: Order 04082160SW Tracking 1Z9W96386868946088

M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>
Re: Order 04082160SW Tracking 1Z9W96386868946088

1 message

Steve Nixon <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com> 16 November 2021 at 09:32

To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Use as you have shown. When | get back I'll update all the prices, for the last two use £57.75 each.

On Tue, 16 Nov 2021, 10:22 Sarah Walton, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Apologies Steve, you have lost me. Same price for both?

Below is the list of items on order.

Parts list:

10 x 0012721 - Previous order was £57.75

10 x 0014895 - Previous order was £25.25

10 x 0012749 - Previous order was £20.90

5x 0014850 - Please can you confirm unit price to use

5x 0014752 - Please can you confirm unit price to use

Please can you confirm prices for all the above, thanks.

Sarah

On Tue, 16 Nov 2021 at 09:14, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com> wrote:
Looks like should be £57.75 for both.
Steve

On Tue, 16 Nov 2021, 08:14 Sarah Walton, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Morning,

Did you manage to look at the pricing for me?

Thanks

Sarah

On Mon, 15 Nov 2021 at 14:13, Steve Nixon <steve.nixon.viamed@googlemail.com> wrote:

I'll check later this afternoon and get back to you.

On Mon, 15 Nov 2021, 13:06 Sarah Walton, <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Steve,

Please see the below from Chris at Just Inc (Thinair Sports)
Can you confirm prices to use for the below - see comments in blue.

Thanks
Sarah
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---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <chris@thinairsports.com>

Date: Mon, 15 Nov 2021 at 10:58

Subject: RE: Order 04082160SW Tracking 1Z9W96386868946088
To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

HI Kate,

Please can | re order some parts?

Parts list:

10 x 0012721 - Previous order was £57.75

10 x 0014895 - Previous order was £25.25

10 x 0012749 - Previous order was £20.90

5x 0014850 - Please can you confirm unit price to use

5x 0014752 - Please can you confirm unit price to use

Delivery address for part number 0012721 is
Nathan Apps

Electromech Assemblies

2 Wilton Rd,

Newington,

Ramsgate

CT12 5HG

The rest of the parts and invoice to:
Christopher Kavanagh,

Just Inc Limited

25 Ashurst Grove

Radcliffe,

Manchester,

M26 1UL

Thanks
Chris

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: 13 August 2021 16:20

To: chris@thinairsports.com

Subject: Order 04082160SW Tracking 1Z29W96386868946088
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Dear Chris,

| am writing to inform you that your order, 04082160SW has been dispatched.

You can track your order on the UPS website, www.ups.com, with the following tracking number
1Z9W96386868946088.

Please see attached delivery note, DVM131992-1.

Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed Ltd
kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered
remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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