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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Korondan Ltd. inquiry

1 message

Korondán József - Korondán Kft. <info@modul-elektronika.hu> 12 November 2021 at 07:33
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Dear Sarah,

 

 

Please quote me again:

 

R-21A sensor – 10 pcs

 

 

Best Regards,

 

Jozsef Korondan

 

Korondan Ltd.

Samsoni road 19

Debrecen

4028

Hungary

 

VAT: HU10721786

 

Tel: +36-20-9328-578

E-mail: info@modul-elektronika.hu

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 9:53 AM

To: Korondán József - Korondán Kft. <info@modul-elektronika.hu>

Subject: Re: Korondan Ltd. inquiry

 

Dear Jozsef,
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Please find attached a proforma invoice for the 10 x R-21A sensors.

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered. 

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 14 May 2021 at 08:27, Korondán József - Korondán Kft. <info@modul-elektronika.hu> wrote:

Please send me a proforma for 10 pcs.
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Best Regards,

 

Jozsef Korondan

 

Korondan Ltd.

Samsoni road 19

Debrecen

4028

Hungary

 

VAT: HU10721786

 

Tel: +36-20-9328-578

E-mail: info@modul-elektronika.hu

 

From: Main Account [mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com] On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 9:14 AM

To: Korondán József - Korondán Kft. <info@modul-elektronika.hu>

Cc: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Subject: Re: Korondan Ltd. inquiry

 

Good morning Jozsef,

 

Thank you for your email.  Please accept my reply.

 

The unit price of the R-21A sensor when purchasing 10 is €26.00 EXW.  We do have stock available.




Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered. 

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Korondán József - Korondán Kft. <info@modul-elektronika.hu>

Date: Fri, 14 May 2021 at 06:41

Subject: Korondan Ltd. inquiry

To: <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

 

Dear Zoey,

 

 

Please quote me again:

 

R21-A – 10 pcs

 

Do you have stock now?
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Best Regards,

 

Jozsef Korondan

 

Korondan Ltd.

Samsoni road 19

Debrecen

4028

Hungary

 

VAT: HU10721786

 

Tel: +36-20-9328-578

E-mail: info@modul-elektronika.hu
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