09/11/2021, 10:25 Gmail - Fwd: Analytical or ITG Oxygen Sensors

M Gma" Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>
Fwd: Analytical or ITG Oxygen Sensors

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> Tue, Nov 9, 2021 at 9:44 AM

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>, Sophie Lines
<sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi,

Please can we send a proforma invoice to Adnan Hashmat at Saim Medical.

Delivery to a UK address, so we will need to add VAT.

Please can you also put a note on the proforma with the balance that is to be paid for his outstanding invoice.

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com>
Date: Tue, 9 Nov 2021 at 09:35

Subject: Re: Analytical or ITG Oxygen Sensors

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan

Here is shipping address
Muhammad Haris

6 Brightside Road
Postal code : M85XJ
+447475643646

Adnan

On Tue, Nov 9, 2021, 14:18 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Adnan

Thank you, please can you send me the delivery address, even if we are not dealing with the carriage, | will still need this to send you a proforma invoice?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
On Tue, 9 Nov 2021 at 04:37, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan

Analytical oxygen sensor for datex ohmeda 50 PCs:
R-30V (0110040) = USD $70

Mox 4 20 PCs.:
T-7V (0110058) = $31.50

MO03 competible 30 PCs:
R-41V (0110041) = $40

Oom204 envitec competible 10 PCs:
R-47V (0110047) = $69

Send proforma invoice
without freight

Adnan
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On Thu, Nov 4, 2021 at 5:41 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Adnan

Please find our USD distributor pricing below (per sensor, EXW):

Analytical oxygen sensor for datex ohmeda 50 PCs:
R-30V (0110040) = USD $70

Mox 20 PCs PCs:
MLF-60HV (0110707) = $93

Mox 4 20 PCs.:
T-7V (0110058) = $31.50

MO03 competible 20 PCs:
R-41V (0110041) = $40

Oom204 envitec competible 10 PCs:
R-47V (0110047) = $69

Maquette oxygen sensor 10 PCs:
Please let me know which model of Maquette you require the sensors for, unfortunately we do not have for the Servo |

Please let me know the delivery details if you wish to proceed with the order. Please note that deliveries to the UK would be subject to 20% tax added to the
above pricing.

Delivery costs to a UK address would be approximately $15-£20 up to 20 kg.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 3 Nov 2021 at 13:26, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
We need some other oxygen sensor
Analytical oxygen sensor for datex ohmeda 50 PCs
Mox 20 PCs PCs
Mox 4 20 PCs.
MO03 competible 20 PCs
Oom204 envitec competible 10 PCs
Magquette oxygen sensor 10 PCs
But all oxygen sensor ship in UK my friend address without invoice

Adnan

On Mon, Apr 12, 2021, 14:25 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Please find your proforma invoice attached.
Please let me know if you have any questions.
Best regards
Ryan
Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
www.viamed.co.uk
Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
On Thu, 8 Apr 2021 at 14:28, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Only parcel force courier

Adnan

On Thu, Apr 8, 2021, 18:17 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Adnan

Thank you for your email.

Do we need to quote for delivery by Parcel Force again or would you accept UPS this time?

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1715943328484484921%7Cmsg-f%3A17159433... 2/11


mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:adnanhashmat82@gmail.com
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:adnanhashmat82@gmail.com
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk

09/11/2021, 10:25

Gmail - Fwd: Analytical or ITG Oxygen Sensors

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 6 Apr 2021 at 19:43, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Sir
We are required flow sensor for drager anesthesia machine 100 pce
And Hamilton flow sensor 100 PC's

Adnan

On Mon, Dec 14, 2020, 14:48 Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Kindly update about shipping
Waiting your positive response

Adnan

On Fri, Dec 11, 2020, 18:01 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

One of my colleagues will be in contact with a proforma invoice.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 11 Dec 2020 at 11:56, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Only ship parcel force or USPS courier only do not ship other courier
Adnan

On Fri, Dec 11, 2020, 16:31 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

| am sorry to inform you that we have a problem with the shipping of your order.

We tried to book a collection today with Parcel Force and unfortunately they have temporarily stopped their Global Priority and Global

Value services to Pakistan due to carrier issues caused by the pandemic. The only service they are currently offering is Global Express,

but this is a much more expensive service:

Global Express = USD $603.74

You have paid for Global Value = USD $437.96

Shortfall = USD $165.78

Please see the following options:

1) We can ship with Parcel Force Global Express, but we would need a payment from you of USD $165.78 for the shortfall
2) We ship by UPS Express Saver = USD $299.93 and then we would then send you a refund for USD $138.03

| am very sorry for the inconvenience caused to you, but we are unable to predict what effects the pandemic may have on your
requested courier. Please can you let me know how you would like to proceed?

| will await your reply.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine
International Sales Manager
VIAMED
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www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 10 Dec 2020 at 11:07, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
We discussed on last Friday you will ship on Wednesday but do not update any tracking number
Kindly update and ship out Good's and tracking number ASAP

Adnan
On Fri, Dec 4, 2020, 14:57 Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan
Thanks for reply we are waiting tracking number EMS courier only do not ship other courier

Adnan

On Fri, Dec 4, 2020, 14:54 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Adnan

It was confirmed last night that the sensors are leaving the USA today, | expect they will reach us by Wednesday.
I'm sorry for the delay, Teledyne have not given any explanation for this, but they still extremely busy.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117

On Tue, 1 Dec 2020, 10:01 Adnan Hashmat, <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Any update about shipping this is to much time
Our customer suffer in this covid condition
Kindly send on urgent basis oxygen sensor

Adnan

On Wed, Nov 25, 2020, 16:13 Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Kindly increase Hamilton flow sensor quantity for sample

Adnan

On Wed, Nov 25, 2020, 15:57 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Adnan

| am sorry to say that they have not arrived with us yet. We have chased them up and the latest news is that they will be
shipped from the USA at the end of this week to arrive with us next week.

| am sorry for the delay and the inconvenience caused. We will continue to chase production.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 24 Nov 2020 at 18:48, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Any update about shipping
Last week November still waiting

Adnan
On Wed, Nov 11, 2020, 20:37 Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Your Hamilton flow sensor part no send please and specific price Hamilton
250 PC's required
When received sample at your side

Adnan

On Wed, Nov 11, 2020, 20:34 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Adnan

We have a 100x R-24 for you and | am hoping the balance will be on it's way to us for next week.
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Please find attached our flow sensor distributor pricing.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 11 Nov 2020 at 15:17, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Hello hope you will be fine
Any update about shipping
We need neunetal Hamilton flow sensor also Drager flow sensors price

Adnan

On Thu, Oct 29, 2020, 14:38 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Adnan

No change.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 28 Oct 2020 at 17:39, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Any update about shipping
Adnan

On Wed, Oct 14, 2020, 8:22 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

| informed you in July that production is typically up to 6 weeks, please understand that there is a

shortage of sensors at the moment because of the increased demands brought on by the pandemic. | will

see if there is anyway to speed them up for you, but | can not make any promises.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
On Wed, 14 Oct 2020 at 16:11, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
This is not fair it's to late
Our order will be cancel
If not supply on demand date

Adnan

On Wed, Oct 14, 2020, 7:30 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

| am sorry, but the latest news is the 3rd week of November.
Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 14 Oct 2020 at 14:02, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan
Any update about shipping

Adnan

On Tue, Oct 6, 2020, 7:56 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Sorry, not as yet, we are waiting on confirmation from Teledyne.
Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 5 Oct 2020 at 13:59, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Any update about shipping

Adnan

On Tue, Sep 29, 2020, 8:35 PM Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan

You will receive tommorow

Keep in touch with your accounts department
Send shipping date . only EMS courier freight

Adnan

On Tue, Sep 29, 2020, 7:52 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thanks Adnan

It has not arrived with our bank as yet, but this is not unusual for

international transactions. We are waiting on stock of the R-24MED, we will let you know

when we have a clear date of arrival.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 29 Sep 2020 at 15:44, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan
Here is payment slip
Kindly contact to your account department

:20:990TT02309241006
:23B:CRED

:26T:GDS
:32A:200929USD8147,96
:33B:USD8147,96
:50K:/AE840230000001002559738
CAPRICORN GOODS WHOLESALERS LLC
P O BOX 42836

DUBAI UAE

:57A:BUKBGB22XXX
:59:/GB82BUKB20784289771244
VIAMED LTD
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United Kingdom

:70:IMPORT OF MEDICAL EQUIPMENT INV NOM
VM 124673

71A:SHA

Adnan

On Mon, Sep 28, 2020, 6:09 PM Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com>
wrote:

Dear Ryan

Thanks for your cooperation

Payment transferd kindly update account department

Adnan

On Mon, Sep 28, 2020, 5:29 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Adnan

| have added a couple of samples to your order.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 28 Sep 2020 at 09:40, Adnan Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com>
wrote:

Dear Ryan

Here is payment slip

Kindly contact to your account department and ship oxygen sensor

Need Hamilton flow sensor sample

After that we will place order 500 PC's

Adnan

On Sat, Sep 26, 2020, 5:59 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Thank you, we will check the bank on Monday.

We do not supply the Envitec flow sensors, but we have our own version
which is manufactured by Bluepoint. You will find our version to be very
accurate and | believe you will find the pricing attractive. Please find our
pricing and information attached.

We currently have 95 boxes in stock (total of 570 sensors).
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Sat, 26 Sep 2020 at 07:04, Adnan Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Payment transferd today may be you will receive on Monday
Kindly when you received my payment ship out our oxygen sensor
And do you have envitec flow sensor for Hamilton
We need 500 PC's

Adnan

On Fri, Sep 25, 2020, 8:59 AM Adnan Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Payment transferd today may be possible you will receive payment on
Monday
Kindly ship this week oxygen sensor and put under invoice and ship with
EMS courier only
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Adnan

On Tue, Sep 8, 2020, 3:05 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>

wrote:

Thank you Adnan

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 8 Sep 2020 at 10:55, Adnan Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan

We will payment transfer next Monday

Adnan

On Tue, Sep 8, 2020, 2:47 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
wrote:

Hi Adnan
| am sorry, that is the best we can do.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 8 Sep 2020 at 06:57, Adnan Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
We are calculate ,USD price convert in local currency we can't
fight with kranz company price
Need little bit discount

Adnan

On Mon, Sep 7, 2020, 10:05 PM Ryan Swaine
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Please find your updated proforma invoice attached.
Please let me know if you have any questions.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 3 Sep 2020 at 13:28, Adnan Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan

Here is picture attached

Adnan
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On Thu, Sep 3, 2020, 5:25 PM Adnan Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan

Yes we need oxygen sensor for Hamilton glelio and datex

ohmeda m-10
Oxygen sensor

Adnan
On Thu, Sep 3, 2020, 5:15 PM Ryan Swaine

<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Originally you required 200x sensors equivalent to the

M-04 / Hamilton Galileo, which we recommended the

R-24MED.

You have mentioned in your recent email that you
require them for the PB840, we would not normally
recommend the R-24MED for this.

There a number of versions of the PB840:

The early version requires the MAX-250 sensor

There are also a number which require the MAX-
250TM

The latest version uses the R-45V - Unfortunately it

could be a number of months before these are
available.

Please can you let me know which model you require
or supply a part number or picture?

With regards to the Datex-Ohmeda sensors, we will
have them available, but there are different models,

please can you supply more information?
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 3 Sep 2020 at 11:34, Adnan Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Here is we need
1-R-17MED 10 PC's
2-analytical for Datex ohmeda oxygen sensor
3-pb840 oxygen sensor. 200 PC's

Adnan

On Thu, Sep 3, 2020, 2:25 PM Ryan Swaine
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Please let me know what changes you need?
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 3 Sep 2020 at 10:21, Adnan Hashmat

<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan

We payment trying to payment transfer but your

email not received
We will payment transfer ASAP

Buy need some changes in proforma invoice

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1715943328484484921%7Cmsg-f%3A17159433...
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Gmail - Fwd: Analytical or ITG Oxygen Sensors

Adnan
On Thu, Sep 3, 2020, 2:19 PM Ryan Swaine
<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Adnan

| hope you are well.

Please can you let me know if this is still a live

project or should we cancel the proforma
invoice?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 11 Aug 2020 at 16:16, Adnan
Hashmat <adnanhashmat82@gmail.com>
wrote:

Dear Ryan

We will payment transfer tomorrow via

Dubai

Adnan

On Wed, Jul 22, 2020, 10:13 PM Ryan
Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Please find your amended proforma
invoice attached.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 22 Jul 2020 at 02:25, Adnan
Hashmat

<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Ryan

Kindly add This oxygen sensor
Teledyne

R-17MED 10 PC's

For demo unit

Adnan

On Fri, Jul 17, 2020, 6:23 PM Ryan

Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Adnan

We only use UPS, but if you have an

account with a particular courier,

then we can arrange collection on

your behalf.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1715943328484484921%7Cmsg-f%3A1715943...
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 17 Jul 2020 at 14:19, Adnan
Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com>
wrote:

Dear Ryan

Do you ship to USPS courier or

parcel force courier

Adnan

On Tue, Jul 14, 2020, 3:51 PM

Ryan Swaine

<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

Please can you provide your
account details for EMS, we do
not have one. We ship by UPS
or we can organise shipping on
your behalf.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 13 Jul 2020 at 17:37,
Adnan Hashmat
<adnanhashmat82@gmail.com>
wrote:

Dear Ryan

This is our first order we are

required

Your special favor

We are working at this time

EMS courier only kindly quote

us EMS courier freight only

Adnan

On Thu, Jul 9, 2020, 12:08

AM Ryan Swaine

<office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Adnan

The estimated dimensions
are as follows:

61x47x42cm, 13kg
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email:
ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=d 104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1715943328484484921%7Cmsg-f%3A1715943...  11/11
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