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M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Purchase Order
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 5 November 2021 at 09:20

To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: IRC Service Department <service@instrument-repairs.com>
Date: Fri, 5 Nov 2021 at 09:16

Subject: RE: Purchase Order

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Good morning

Please find attached another order.

Please issue a proforma and we can get this paid, otherwise if order is suffice then that’s great.

Kind Regards,

Ryan English

IRC Service Department

Instrument Repairs & Calibration

Unit 5

Howard Court Industrial Estate

East Kilbride

G74 4QZ

Tel: 01355 264120

Fax: 01355 264150

E-Mail: service@instrument-repairs.com

Web: www.instrument-sales.com
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CONFIDENTIALITY

This e-mail message and any attachments thereto, is intended only for use by the addressee(s) named herein and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not
the intended recipient of this e-mail message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail message, and any attachments thereto, is strictly prohibited.
If you have received this e-mail message in error, please immediately notify the sender and permanently delete the original and any copies of this email and any prints thereof.

ABSENT AN EXPRESS STATEMENT TO THE CONTRARY HEREINABOVE, THIS E-MAIL IS NOT INTENDED AS A SUBSTITUTE FOR A WRITING. Notwithstanding the Uniform Electronic
Transactions Act or the applicability of any other law of similar substance and effect, absent an express statement to the contrary hereinabove, this e-mail message its contents, and any
attachments hereto are not intended to represent an offer or acceptance to enter into a contract and are not otherwise intended to bind the sender, IRC Ltd (or any of its subsidiaries), or any

other person or entity.

From: IRC Service Department <service@instrument-repairs.com>
Sent: 05 October 2021 11:06

To: 'sales@viamed.co.uk' <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: 'orders@viamed.co.uk' <orders@viamed.co.uk>

Subject: Purchase Order

Good morning

Please find attached purchase order.

Please issue a proforma and we can get this paid, otherwise if order is suffice then that’s great.

Thanks

Kind Regards,

Ryan English

IRC Service Department

Instrument Repairs & Calibration

Unit 5
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Howard Court Industrial Estate
East Kilbride

G74 4Qz

Tel: 01355 264120
Fax: 01355 264150

E-Mail: service@instrument-repairs.com

Web: www.instrument-sales.com
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CONFIDENTIALITY

This e-mail message and any attachments thereto, is intended only for use by the addressee(s) named herein and may contain legally privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not
the intended recipient of this e-mail message, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this e-mail message, and any attachments thereto, is strictly prohibited.
If you have received this e-mail message in error, please immediately notify the sender and permanently delete the original and any copies of this email and any prints thereof.

ABSENT AN EXPRESS STATEMENT TO THE CONTRARY HEREINABOVE, THIS E-MAIL IS NOT INTENDED AS A SUBSTITUTE FOR A WRITING. Notwithstanding the Uniform Electronic
Transactions Act or the applicability of any other law of similar substance and effect, absent an express statement to the contrary hereinabove, this e-mail message its contents, and any
attachments hereto are not intended to represent an offer or acceptance to enter into a contract and are not otherwise intended to bind the sender, IRC Ltd (or any of its subsidiaries), or any

other person or entity.
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