
04/11/2021, 12:11 Gmail - CORRECTION: XHALE SA | Teledyne FINAL ASSY SENSOR UFO−130−2 | New Order 100 PCS

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=97ca69e8f6&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1715499247530185556%7Cmsg-f%3A1715499247… 1/5

Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

CORRECTION: XHALE SA | Teledyne FINAL ASSY SENSOR UFO−130−2 | New
Order 100 PCS

1 message

Dimitrios Charalambidis <dimitrios@endomedical.co> 4 November 2021 at 12:05
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Apostolos Atsalakis <apostolos@endomedical.co>

Dear Sarah,

I am sorry for the confusion. 

I have your proforma invoice MVM132934 - Xhale.pdf for 100 pieces (see attached).
I also have your proforma invoice MVM133173 - Xhale.pdf for 50 pieces (see attached).
Please share a proforma invoice for the 50 reserved pieces and add UPS Courier Delivery - Express Saver


I will proceed with the payment of 200 pieces in total as soon as I hear from you.


Thank you for your help.

Best regards,

Dimitrios

Dimitrios Charalambidis
Head of Operations | ENDO Medical, Inc & XHALE SA | https://pnoe.com

PNOĒ DISCLAIMER The Information in this email is
intended for educational purposes only and is not intended to
diagnose or treat
any health condition or illness.


On Thu, Nov 4, 2021 at 1:59 PM Dimitrios Charalambidis <dimitrios@endomedical.co> wrote:

Hi Sarah,


Thanks for the update. As per my email of the 24th of September (see in blue below), we will also need to receive
our reserved 50 sensors. 


I will make a payment for the MVM132934.pdf proforma invoice (100 pieces) (see attached)
Please share a proforma invoice for the additional 50 pieces and add UPS Courier Delivery - Express Saver
or you can send me the MVM132934.pdf proforma invoice as amended proforma for 150 pieces. Whatever
works best for you.


I will proceed with the payment as soon as I hear from you.


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Dimitrios Charalambidis <dimitrios@endomedical.co>

Date: Fri, 24 Sept 2021 at 14:18

Subject: XHALE SA | Teledyne FINAL ASSY SENSOR UFO−130−2 | New Order 100+50 PCS

To: Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Steve Nixon <steve.nixon@viamed.co.uk>, Apostolos Atsalakis <apostolos@endomedical.co>





Dear Sarah,



We would like to order the Teledyne FINAL ASSY SENSOR UFO−130−2 in 100 units. Please advise about
the lead time.

Please, send me a proforma invoice for this order at your earliest convenience.
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