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M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: order of oxygen sensors
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 2 November 2021 at 09:20
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>, Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>

Please can we arrange to send Elaine at Farstar a proforma for the the 500x R-17MED sensors.

Please use standard USD distributor pricing.

Thank you

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: elaine chu <elaine@farstar.com.cn>

Date: Tue, 2 Nov 2021 at 01:47

Subject: Re: order of oxygen sensors

To: ryan.swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan

Thanks Ryan, I'm fine, too. Have you ever come to China since last year? I'm basically stay in China.
As you said the price is increased, | know current situation but business needs to be going on.

We'd like to order 500pcs R-17MED oxygen sensors. Could you send Pl to me so that we could

arrange the payment.

Best regards

Elaine Chu International Sales Manager
Whatsapp: +86-15852760160

Farstar Group (Aust) Pty Ltd. China Factory
Add: F7&F8 of C8, No0.1699 Huishan Road,
Huishan Distrcit, Wuxi, Jiangsu, China

Tel: 86-510-85226288 Mob: 86-15852760160

Website: www.farstar.com.cn

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=97 ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1715307627611772671%7Cmsg-f%3A1715307627... 1/3
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From: "office"<office@viamed.co.uk>;
Date: Fri, Oct 29, 2021 05:47 PM

To: "elaine"<elaine@farstar.com.cn>;
Subject: Re: order of oxygen sensors

Hi Elaine
It is great to hear from you. | am very well, thank you. | hope you are too?
We can have 500x R-17MED available for you in approximately 4 weeks time.

Unfortunately Teledyne have increased the pricing of the R-17MED sensors and no longer offer us the special
discount we used to receive for sensors supplied into China.

The current price would be USD $34.50 each EXW
I look forward to hearing back from you and please let me know if you have any further questions.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
On Fri, 29 Oct 2021 at 03:57, elaine chu <elaine@farstar.com.cn> wrote:
Hello Ryan
Long time no contact with you. Hope everything going on well with you.
I'm writing this mail to confirm with you the stock of Teledyne R17 and also
the price. We'd like to order 500 pcs oxygen sensors.
Looking forward to your reply.

Best regards

Elaine Chu International Sales Manager
Whatsapp: +86-15852760160

Farstar Group (Aust) Pty Ltd. China Factory
Add: F7&F8 of C8, No.1699 Huishan Road,
Huishan Distrcit, Wuxi, Jiangsu, China

Tel: 86-510-85226288 Mob: 86-15852760160

Website: www.farstar.com.cn
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