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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: cells

1 message

Steve Nixon <office@viamed.co.uk> 27 October 2021 at 11:43
Reply-To: steve.nixon@vandagraphst.com
To: Dennis Vessey <dennis.vessey@btconnect.com>
Cc: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vandagraphst.com>

Hi Dennis

As discussed, you confirmed that you require 100 x 8010012 oxygen sensors to be produced ASAP, dated
November/December and you require another batch of 100 dated for February 2022.

Regards

Steve

On Wed, 27 Oct 2021 at 10:54, Dennis Vessey <dennis.vessey@btconnect.com> wrote:


Steve

  I could do with another 100 cells please I am sure I have some due soon but can you confirm a delivery date
pleas ?  Let me know if I owe you anything my accounts lady has been working from home and some payments are
getting missed

 

Regards,

Dennis Vessey & Co

Fernery Lane

Barnetby

North Lincolnshire

England

DN38 6HN

Telephone: +44 1652 688904

VAT No  317271374

phone +441652688904

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This message and its attachments, if any, is

 strictly private and confidential and is intended only for use by the

 addressee. Any disclosure, copying, distribution or other action taken

 in reliance of the information contained in this e-mail is strictly prohibited.

If you have received this transmission in error, please use the reply

function to tell me and then permanently delete what you have received.
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Steve
 
 
Steve Nixon
Director - Vandagraph Sensor Technologies Ltd.

Office:  +44 (0)1535 634900
Mobile: +44 (0)7850 252267


