27/10/2021, 11:31 Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor; Capnography

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Oxygen sensor; Capnography

1 message

info@medara.fi <info@medara.fi> 27 October 2021 at 11:22
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hi Kate,

Ok, I'll order 1pcs 0110431 MAX-250A Oxygen sensor
Here is the address for delivery and invoice :

Medara

Ari Ampiala

Sulvantie 559

65450 Sulva

Finland

VAT FI21025418

tel+358445572460

Please send the proforma invoice for this email address. info@medara.fi

Best regards

Ari

Kate Griffiths kirjoitti 2021-10-27 11:43:
Good morning Ari,
Thank you for your email. The price of part number 0110431 - Oxygen
sensor MAX-250A is €65.60 each EXW. This item is currently in
stock.
If you would like a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges (UPS)
and insurance, | would need your delivery and invoice addresses in
order to set up a new account for you. Payment is accepted by bank

transfer or PayPal, (which incurs a 6% fee of total order).

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance.
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Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales
and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely.

Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd [1]
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy [2]

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally
privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by
anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,
distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on
it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be
removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject
line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 27 Oct 2021 at 08:18, <info@medara.fi> wrote:
Dear Kate,

Thank you for the offer. Unfortenately | didn’t get deal for the
Capnograph. But | would like to buy 1 pcs 0110431 MAX-250A Oxygen
sensor. Could you send me a price, delivery time and cost of
delivery?

What courier service do you normally use for shipping?

Best regards
Ari

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1710142521396606334%7Cmsg-f%3A171476795...  2/6


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:info@medara.fi

27/10/2021, 11:31 Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor; Capnography

Medara
Sulvantie 559
65450 Sulva
Finland

tel. +358445572460

Kate Griffiths kirjoitti 2021-09-06 17:44:
Hi Ari,

Thank you for your reply.

Please see attached leaflets relating to oxygen sensors and
VM2500.

The price breaks for part number 4410530 - Capnograph VM-2500-M
Veterinary version (mainstream) are as follows:

1-4=€1,790.00 each EXW
5 or more = € 1,490.00 each EXW

The same prices apply for part number 4410540 - Capnograph
VM-2500-S

Veterinary version (sidestream).

The capnographs are supplied with a pulse oximetry sensor of your

choice:

1) 0015000 standard lingual clip sensor
or
2) 0015002 multi-site Y sensor.

If customer chooses option 2), then we also add one of the
following
at no charge:

a) 0025010 lingual clip - small or b) 0025011 lingual clip -
medium or
c) 0025012 lingual clip - large

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance,
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow
sales

and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely.

Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but

please continue to use email where possible.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b587 1a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1710142521396606334%7Cmsg-f%3A171476795...  3/6



27/10/2021, 11:31 Gmail - Re: Oxygen sensor; Capnography

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd [1] [1]
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy [2] [2]

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally

privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by

anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,

distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on

it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to
be

removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject

line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 6 Sept 2021 at 15:23, Medara <info@medara.fi> wrote:
Hi Kate,
Thank you for your quick answer. We are a distributor.
Best Regards

Arri
Kate Griffiths kirjoitti 6.9.2021 klo 13.40:

Good morning Ari,
Thank you for your enquiry.
We do not have a distributor for the VET monitors in Finland.

Please could | ask if you are a clinic or a distributor? Then |
can
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advise you further.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Giriffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow
sales

and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely.

Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but

please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd [1] [1]
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy [2]

[2]

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally

privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by

anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying,

distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance

on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like

to
be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 6 Sept 2021 at 10:03, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <info@medara.fi>

Date: Mon, 6 Sept 2021 at 10:02
Subject: Oxygen sensor; Capnography
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To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sir/Madam

| would like to ask if you have a distributor of oxygen sensors
i Capnography VM2500 for Veterinary in Finland?

Best Regards

Ari Ampiala

+3585572460

Medara

[1] http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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