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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H

1 message

jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> 25 October 2021 at 15:29
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

dear kate 
good day 
for oxygen sensor  model R-17MED ITS AVAILABLE  
IF YES PLEASE ADD 3 PCS WITH ORDER 
I 

Best Regards 

Jumah Mosbah 
Manager Director 
Asil Health Care 
Tel: 00962 6 4625411
Fax: 00962 6 4622895
Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961
Ben Khaldoun St. 34 
P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan

On Wed, 13 Oct 2021 at 15:42, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Jumah,


Thank you for your reply.


Please see attached updated proforma invoice.  The insurance and carriage
charges have been updated.


Please let me know if you require any further changes.


Many thanks.


Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please continue to use
email where possible.
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