
25/10/2021, 08:59 Gmail - Re: For Blease Anaesthetic Machine Parts

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1713874949051462216%7Cmsg-f%3A171455192… 1/3

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: For Blease Anaesthetic Machine Parts

1 message

Marx Yabri <timlonltd@gmail.com> 25 October 2021 at 02:08
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Thanks Kate,

Please do a Proforma Invoice for 3 X Oxygen Sensor (0110431 - oxygen sensor MAX-250A).
For your information, we have around 100 Blease focus & sirus model Anaesthetic machines and they are due for
some service, I therefore will require these sensors regularly.

Here is my Postal Address;
Marx Yabri (Mr)
Timlon Limited 
C/- Kambual Medical Clinic,
Suite 2B, 1stFloor, Handy Centre, Sect 13,Lot05. Hagwa street.
P.O Box 753, Boroko,NCD, Port Moresby
Papua New Guinea
Ph 675,70452728  3236563

Thank you

Kind regards

Marx Yabri (Manager)
Timlon Ltd

On Mon, Oct 25, 2021 at 12:30 AM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Marx,


Thank you for your reply.


I would be happy to issue you with a proforma invoice for 3 x 0110431 - oxygen sensor MAX-250A


I do need you delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up an account for you and to give you accurate
shipping costs.



Many thanks.


Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.


If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------




On Sat, 23 Oct 2021 at 02:06, Marx Yabri <timlonltd@gmail.com> wrote:


Hi Kate


It's Marx Yabri from Timlon Ltd PNG. Sadly we all are taking precaution measures to avoid COVID. I'm also
operating at home.
Anyway please send me a quotation for 3 X MAX 250A oxygen sensor. 
Take care


Kind regards
Marx Yabri
Manager (Timlon Ltd)


On Mon, Oct 18, 2021, 10:57 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:


Good afternoon Marx,


Thank you for your email.


From your list we can only offer the oxygen sensor 0110431 - oxygen sensor MAX-250A.  I have attached a
technical specification so you can see if this meets your needs.


The prices in USD are as follows:


1 = $
103.25 
2 = $ 92.93 each

EXW 
3 - 10 = $ 87.76 each
EXW 
11 or more  = $ 82.60 each

EXW


Please let me know if you require a proforma invoice detailing carriage charges, bank charges and
insurance  - if so I would need you delivery and invoice addresses - or if you require any further information.


Kind regards


Kate Griffiths


Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Sun, 17 Oct 2021 at 14:48, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:





---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Marx Yabri <timlonltd@gmail.com>

Date: Sat, 16 Oct 2021 at 14:36

Subject: For Blease Anaesthetic Machine Parts

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>





Hi there,


Im Marx Yabri, from Papua New Guinea. I am looking for the parts for Blease Spacelab Focus
Anaesthetc Machine;


Please kindly do a quotation for the following parts
1. Oxygen sensors x3
2. Flow sensor Adult x 3
3. Flow sensor Pediatric x 3
4. PM Kit or service kit x 3


Please let me know if require more details.


Many thanks


Marx Yabri
Timlon Limited (PNG)
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