13/10/2021, 13:16 Gmail - Re: flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H

1 message

jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> 13 October 2021 at 12:29

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Hello
2 x 0110021 ($37.75) (singles)

Best Regards

Jumah Mosbah

Manager Director

Asil Health Care

Tel: 00962 6 4625411

Fax: 00962 6 4622895

Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961
Ben Khaldoun St. 34

P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan

On Wed, 13 Oct 2021 at 14:21, Kate Giriffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Jumah,

Thank you for your reply.

Do you require 2 x 0110021 ($37.75) (singles) or 0110072 ($75.50) (pack of 2), both are in stock.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
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On Wed, 13 Oct 2021 at 12:09, jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Kate Griffiths
Many thanks for your email
| want to add the sensor R-22MEDV QTY=2 to the order,

Best Regards

Jumah Mosbah

Manager Director

Asil Health Care

Tel: 00962 6 4625411

Fax: 00962 6 4622895

Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961
Ben Khaldoun St. 34

P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan

On Tue, 12 Oct 2021 at 10:29, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Good morning Jusbah,

Please see attached proforma invoice as discussed with Ryan.

Please let me know if you require any changes to be made, eg. addresses.

The proforma invoice is valid for 30 days and the payment details are at the bottom on the left hand side.
Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 11 Oct 2021 at 15:50, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Kate

It is for 2x R-49V. Unfortunately we do not have a suitable sensor for line 2.

Thank you
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Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, 11 Oct 2021 at 15:36

Subject: Re: flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan
Many thanks for your support,
| would purchase the following:

1. R-49V - part no. 0110049 QTY =2
2. oxygen sensor for hamilton ventilator type : C1 C2, C3,C6,T1,MR1 QTY 2

Those items are samples for evaluation, as | will handle their costs.
Best Regards

Jumah Mosbah

Manager Director

Asil Health Care

Tel: 00962 6 4625411

Fax: 00962 6 4622895

Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961

Ben Khaldoun St. 34
P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan

On Mon, 11 Oct 2021 at 13:00, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Jumah

Ventilators do not normally require a matched pair of sensors, this is something that would normally be
used in incubators where they are using two sensors that have to have nearly the same output.

If your customers are confident they require the R-22MEDV, then you can still purchase these as a
single sensor:

R-22MEDV - part no. for single pieces 0110021 = USD $37.75 each EXW

If you are supplying the sensors for use in incubators, then you should consider the R-22Vi Matched
pair, these have been specifically designed for use in incubators:

R-22Vi- 0110072 = USD 75.50 / pack of 2 sensors EXW

| am sorry to add more confusion, but if you need the sensors for the Hamilton ventilators you
listed (G5/S1,GALileo,raphael), then | would recommend the following sensor:

R-49V - part no. 0110049 = USD $37.75 each EXW
Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards
Ryan
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