12/10/2021, 15:50 Gmail - Fwd: order oxygensensor Bruins Hardenberg

M Gma” Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Fwd: order oxygensensor Bruins Hardenberg

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 12 October 2021 at 15:27

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>, Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

The sensor covercap that they mentioned is part no. 0120080 and we have some stock in the shelves with the
duckets on the window wall of the warehouse. Trade price is £0.25 each.

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Hans Bruins <hans@)janbruins.nl>

Date: Tue, 12 Oct 2021 at 15:18

Subject: order oxygensensor Bruins Hardenberg

To: jean@vandagraph.co.uk <jean@vandagraph.co.uk>

Good afternoon Jean,

Hereby my order:

1X Part number 0110237
Product name R-17S1 Oxygen Sensor (if possible with covercap for sensor 2x )
1X Part number 0110217
Product name R-17VAN Oxygen Sensor
1X Partnumber 0110238
Product name R R-22AT Oxygen Sensor
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12/10/2021, 15:50 Gmail - Fwd: order oxygensensor Bruins Hardenberg
Delivry Adress; Jan Bruins en Zn. BV.(if send by package service)

De Nieuwe Haven 17
7772 BC Hardenberg

Netherlands

Jan Bruins en Zn. BV. (if send to P.O. Box)
Postbus 4

7770 AA Hardenberg

Netherlands

VAT Number : NL 001580905B02

If payment in advance is requiert please send invoice by mail to : fakturen@janbruins.nl

Highest regards,

Hans Bruins

0031(0)6-55702291.
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