11/10/2021, 15:54 Gmail - Fwd: flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 11 October 2021 at 15:49

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate
It is for 2x R-49V. Unfortunately we do not have a suitable sensor for line 2.

Thank you

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, 11 Oct 2021 at 15:36

Subject: Re: flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan
Many thanks for your support,
| would purchase the following:

1. R-49V - part no. 0110049 QTY =2
2. oxygen sensor for hamilton ventilator type : C1 C2, C3,C6,T1,MR1 QTY 2

Those items are samples for evaluation, as | will handle their costs.
Best Regards

Jumah Mosbah

Manager Director

Asil Health Care

Tel: 00962 6 4625411

Fax: 00962 6 4622895

Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961
Ben Khaldoun St. 34

P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan

On Mon, 11 Oct 2021 at 13:00, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Jumah

Ventilators do not normally require a matched pair of sensors, this is something that would normally be used in
incubators where they are using two sensors that have to have nearly the same output.

If your customers are confident they require the R-22MEDV, then you can still purchase these as a single sensor:
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R-22MEDV - part no. for single pieces 0110021 = USD $37.75 each EXW

If you are supplying the sensors for use in incubators, then you should consider the R-22Vi Matched pair, these
have been specifically designed for use in incubators:

R-22Vi- 0110072 = USD 75.50 / pack of 2 sensors EXW

| am sorry to add more confusion, but if you need the sensors for the Hamilton ventilators you listed
(G5/S1,GALileo,raphael), then | would recommend the following sensor:

R-49V - part no. 0110049 = USD $37.75 each EXW
Please let me know if you have any questions.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 8 Oct 2021 at 07:23, jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
Hallo Ryan
Can you please advise me about the oxygen sensor
Thanks
ASIL HEALTH care
Jumah mosbah

On Tue, Oct 5, 2021, 5:25 PM jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan
Hope this email finds you well
| am quite confused, however, the sensor should fit with hamilton ventilator G5/S1,GALileo,raphael,
Please send me a picture of the sensor( MATCHED PAIR)

Best Regards

Jumah Mosbah

Manager Director

Asil Health Care

Tel: 00962 6 4625411

Fax: 00962 6 4622895

Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961
Ben Khaldoun St. 34

P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan

On Tue, 5 Oct 2021 at 11:44, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Jumah

The R-22MEDV - 0110021 is the exact same sensor as what is supplied in the pack of 2 (0110071), but
they are no longer supplied as a matched pair.

If they need to be matched to each other, then it would not be useful to try them, as one pair may work
and another may not. If you can give me the details of the product they are going to be working in, then |
can check if they need to be matched for you?

Best regards

Ryan
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Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 4 Oct 2021 at 19:46, jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
Hallo
Oxygen sensor for Hamilton ventilator model : R-22MEDV - 0110021
Thanks
ASIL HEALTH care
Jumah mosbah

On Mon, Oct 4, 2021, 7:30 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Jumah

Just to clarify, you need samples of the new model: R-22Vi?
Do they definitely need them as a matched pair?
Please can you let me know which equipment the sensors are to be used with?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 4 Oct 2021 at 14:45, jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
thank you for your reply
requiest are :
R-22MEDV - 0110021 = USD $37.75 each EXW
as in attached
S0, its possible to request 2 pcs as sample , please advise
S, you are,

Best Regards

Jumah Mosbah

Manager Director

Asil Health Care

Tel: 00962 6 4625411

Fax: 00962 6 4622895

Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961
Ben Khaldoun St. 34

P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan

On Mon, 4 Oct 2021 at 11:31, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Jumah

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1713335246081272955%7Cmsg-f%3A1713335246...

3/6


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
mailto:jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com
mailto:office@viamed.co.uk

11/10/2021, 15:54

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1713335246081272955%7Cmsg-f%3A1713335246...

Gmail - Fwd: flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H

| am sorry to say that the R-22MEDV are no longer available as a matched pair, they have been
superseded by by the following:
R-22Vi - 0110072 = USD 75.50 / pack of 2 EXW

The R-22MEDV is still available as a single sensor, but not as a matched pair:
R-22MEDV - 0110021 = USD $37.75 each EXW

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Sun, 3 Oct 2021 at 07:56, jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
Good morning
Code No 0011071
Model R22 MEDV. for Hamilton ventilator
Matched pair
Thanks
ASIL HEALTH care
Jumah mosbah

On Fri, Oct 1, 2021, 4:27 PM jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
Here the picture
Thanks

On Fri, Oct 1, 2021, 2:53 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Jumah

Thank you very much for your email. | can not see the attached picture, please can you
resend it?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 1 Oct 2021 at 12:47, jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
Good Day
Hope you are doing well and safe
We have tender order for items oxygen sensor for Hamilton ventilator QTY 300pcs
Please check attached picture
& let us know the price,
The result to confirm order needs
Some times 3 months.
Best regards
ASIL HEALTH care
Jumah mosbah
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On Fri, Aug 13, 2021, 6:09 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Thank you very much Jumah and best of luck with the tender. Please just let me
know if there is anything you need or if you have any questions.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Fri, 13 Aug 2021 at 14:05, jumah musbah <jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com>
wrote:
Hi Ryan
Thank you for your reply and support.
Please be informed that request is not confirmed yet. may will take a time-about 4-
5 months once we receive the final approval & win the order i keep you updated.
Thanks
ASIL HEALTH care
Jumah mosbah

On Fri, Aug 13, 2021, 1:59 PM Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Jumah

We should be able to supply the complete quantity within approximately 8 weeks
from receipt of order.

Would you require the complete order or would you accept part shipments?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
On Thu, 12 Aug 2021 at 17:20, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
wrote:

Hi Jumah

| am very well, thank you.

We currently have around 4000-5000 available from stock, but | will try and
find out tomorrow how quick we can get more.

Do you know when the tender would likely be awarded and what sort if
delivery time your clients would expect?
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SpiroTrue H - part no. 4310003 = USD $34.20 / pack of 6 pieces

| look forward to your reply.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 12 Aug 2021 at 14:50, jumah musbah
<jumah.musbah.care@gmail.com> wrote:
DEAR Rayan GOOD DAY
HOPE YOU ARE DOING GOOD & SAFE
| HAVE tender for flow sensor SPIRO TRUE H QTY 10000 PCS
PLEASE ADVISE ME FOR PRICE DELIVERY TIME

Best Regards

Jumah Mosbah

Manager Director

Asil Health Care

Tel: 00962 6 4625411

Fax: 00962 6 4622895

Mobile & WhatsApp: 00962 79 5673961
Ben Khaldoun St. 34

P.O. Box: 830093 Amman 11183 Jordan
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