07/10/2021, 07:35 Gmail - Re: Shipment

M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Re: Shipment

1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 6 October 2021 at 14:52
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sarah,

Please send new proforma invoice for 10 Pcs R-24MED Oxygen sensors
Pyment GBP through bank transfer(TT)

Best regards,
Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Mon, Oct 4, 2021, 6:22 PM Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

Already settled the payment via TT, please find enclosed attachment
Thank you,

Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates

Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Oct 1, 2021 at 4:39 PM Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Sarah,

Thank you very much for ready package collection and warranty replacements oxygen sensors.
Ok.will arrange package Pickup

Today already settled the payment via TT
GBP 1,146.00 will send copy of TT acknowledgement once received from bank.

Many thanks,
Best regards,
Sudath Weeraman

Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Oct 1, 2021, 4:25 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Sudath,

Please find attached copies of the invoices for your order and warranty replacements that are now ready for
collecting.

The weight and dimensions are as follows:

1.80kg
31x31x25cm

Kind regards
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