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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

FW: EXTERNAL: Re: FW: SM - Quotation of 5x Sensor 0110017, PO 470020401

1 message

Janda, Patrik (MCZH) <Patrik.Janda@smiths-medical.com> 6 October 2021 at 14:04
To: "sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk" <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "Kovar, Miroslav (MCZH)" <Miroslav.Kovar@smiths-medical.com>

Dear Sarah,

 

Please attached the order for 5x sensor. (PO 470020401)

Many thanks for processing this order and once the goods is ready for shipment please let me know – I can make
collection at our account (will need HS code)

 

Many thanks

Patrik

 

 

Patrik Janda

Service Centre

Tel: +420 581 671 171    

Mob: +420 739 38 19 38

 

From: Main Account
viamedinbox@gmail.com On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: Friday, October 1, 2021 4:53 PM

To: Janda, Patrik (MCZH) <Patrik.Janda@smiths-medical.com>

Subject: EXTERNAL: Re: FW: SM - Quotation of 5x Sensor 0110017

 

CAUTION: This email came from outside Smiths Group. Be cautious with the contents unless you can confirm the
sender is genuine.

 

Dear Patrik,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

Please find attached a quotation for your reference.

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:Patrik.Janda@smiths-medical.com
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Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered. 

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to
www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Fri, 1 Oct 2021 at 14:53, Janda, Patrik (MCZH) <Patrik.Janda@smiths-medical.com> wrote:

 

 

 

Dear Sarah,

 

Can you please quote for me 5x sensor 0110017?

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk/
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Only for reference: Last order was in May 2021 (delivery note,  DVM130219-1 and invoice, RVM130219-1)

 

 

Many thanks for your kind support,

Patrik Janda

 

 

Patrik Janda

Technical Services and Support Manager

Global Service Operations

Smiths Medical Czech Republic a.s.

Olomoucká 306, Hranice 753 01, Czech Republic

Tel: +420 581 671 171    

Mob: +420 739 38 19 38


patrik.janda@smiths-medical.com

www.smiths-medical.com

 

 

PROPRIETARY: This e-mail contains proprietary information some or all of which may be legally privileged. It is
intended for the recipient only. If an addressing or transmission error has misdirected this e-mail, please notify the
author
by replying to this e-mail. If you are not the intended recipient you must not use, disclose, distribute, copy,
print, or rely on this e-mail.

************************************************ 

CAUTION:THIS MESSAGE ORIGINATED FROM THE PUBLIC INTERNET AND WAS NOT SENT FROM THE
SMITHS EMAIL SYSTEM

************************************************

PROPRIETARY: This e-mail contains proprietary information some or all of which may be legally privileged. It is
intended for the recipient only. If an addressing or transmission error has misdirected this e-mail, please notify the
author by replying to this
e-mail. If you are not the intended recipient you must not use, disclose, distribute, copy,
print, or rely on this e-mail.
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