06/10/2021, 11:39 Gmail - RE: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
RE: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)

1 message

Stefan Zoltan <stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu> 6 October 2021 at 10:42

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Dear Kate,

| choose order number 0111261.

Thank you for your support.

Best Regards/Udvézlettel

Stefan Zoltan

Sales Support Technical Manager

Vatner Medical, Vatner Kft

1095 Budapest, Ipar utca 5. / lll. em., DownTown Office Building
mobil: 00-36-30-1513571

e-mail: stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu

web: www.vatner.hu
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06/10/2021, 11:39 Gmail - RE: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Wednesday, October 6, 2021 9:29 AM

To: Stefan Zoltan <stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu>

Subject: Re: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)

Good morning Stefan

Thank you for your reply. Please could | ask which MaxO2+AE you require - 0111261 or 01112627

Part number 0111261 has a longer sensor cable - coiled cable length: 3ft (0.9m, extends to 10ft (3.0m). This
item is currently in stock

Part number 0111262 has a shorter sensor cable - coiled cable length: 2ft (0.6m), extends to 6.5ft (2.0m). This
item is NOT currently in stock.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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06/10/2021, 11:39 Gmail - RE: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 6 Oct 2021 at 07:48, Stefan Zoltan <stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu> wrote:

Dear Kate,

MAX02+AE seems a good choice.

Please send the proforma invoice including all costs. (delivery address: HUNGARY, 7400 Kaposvar, Kenyérgyar u.1.)

Best Regards/Udvézlettel

Stefan Zoltan

Sales Support Technical Manager

Vatner Medical, Vatner Kft

1095 Budapest, Ipar utca 5. / lll. em., DownTown Office Building
mobil: 00-36-30-1513571

e-mail: stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu

web: www.vatner.hu
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06/10/2021, 11:39 Gmail - RE: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Tuesday, October 5, 2021 9:32 AM

To: Stefan Zoltan <stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu>

Subject: Re: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300

Good morning Stefan,

Thank you for your reply. Please see attached technical specifications as requested.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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06/10/2021, 11:39 Gmail - RE: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 5 Oct 2021 at 07:19, Stefan Zoltan <stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu> wrote:

Dear Kate,

I would need more technical details about the MaxO2+AE (pn: 0111261 and 0111262).

Could you send me techniacal data sheet about its.
Our Tax number: 11814292-2-14

Thank you for your support.

Best Regards/Udvozlettel

Stefan Zoltan

Sales Support Technical Manager

Vatner Medical, Vatner Kft

1095 Budapest, Ipar utca 5. / lll. em., DownTown Office Building
mobil: 00-36-30-1513571

e-mail: stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu

web: www.vatner.hu
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06/10/2021, 11:39 Gmail - RE: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, October 4, 2021 4:42 PM

To: stefan.zoltan@vatner.hu

Subject: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300

Good afternoon Stefan,
Thank you for your enquiry. Unfortunately, we are no longer able to supply the AX300 due to CE certification.

Some alternatives are as follows:

0111261 - Oxygen analyser MaxO2+AE - €256.90 each EXW (currently in stock)

0111262 - Oxygen analyser MaxO2+AE External sensor - €256.90 each EXW (not currently in stock)
0111250 - Handi+ Oxygen analyser with integral sensor - €133 each EXW (currently in stock)

| have attached a leaflet for your information so you can see if any are useful to you.

Please let me know if | can be of any further assistance.

| would be happy to issue a proforma invoice if you decide to proceed. | would need your delivery and invoice
addresses in order to create a new account for you.

Please could | ask you for your VAT number?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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06/10/2021, 11:39 Gmail - RE: Enquiry via Nufer medical for AX300 (MAX02+AE)
Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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