M Gmail

New order, mlinke 4 X 2021

1 message

mlinke www.mlinke.eu <sklep@mariuszlinke.pl>

To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello Ryan ;)

At beginning I send you big smile ;)

Please send me valuation for 7 pcs of R-17 sensor.

Best regards,
mlinke ;)

www.mlinke.eu
sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount
tel. 0048 793 540 230

AL

Mmlinke

www.omlinke.ew

Wystaw opinie o naszej firmie w Google tutaj: dodaj opinie!
Pomysl o srodowisku! Nie drukuj tej wiadomosci jesli nie jest to konieczne.

Ta wiadomos¢ e-mail jest wolna od wirusow i ztosliwego oprogramowania,
poniewaz ochrona ESET NOD32 Antivirus jest aktywna.

ESET NOD32

Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

4 October 2021 at 14:19

Otrzymana wiadomos¢ jest poufna i stanowi tajemnice przedsigbiorstwa. Nie wolno jej ujawnia¢ osobom trzecim.
This message is confidential and a business secret. The contents may not be disclosed to third parties.

24 czerwca 2021 11:07 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):

Hi Mariusz

Sorry, it is now set as an order, as | have scheduled it for dispatch this afternoon.

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 24 Jun 2021 at 09:58, mlinke www.mlinke.eu < sklep@mariuszlinke.pl> wrote:

There is no proforma in attachement.

Best regards,
mlinke ;)

www.mlinke.eu

sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount

tel. 0048 793 540 230
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Wystaw opinie o naszej firmie w Google tutaj: dodaj opinie!
Pomysl o srodowisku! Nie drukuj tej wiadomosci jesli nie jest to konieczne.

Ta wiadomos¢ e-mail jest wolna od wiruséw i ztosliwego oprogramowania,
poniewaz ochrona ESET NOD32 Antivirus jest aktywna.

ESET NOD32

Otrzymana wiadomos$¢ jest poufna i stanowi tajemnice przedsigbiorstwa. Nie wolno jej ujawnia¢ osobom trzecim.
This message is confidential and a business secret. The contents may not be disclosed to third parties.

24 czerwca 2021 10:47 Ryan Swaine < office@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):

Hi Mariusz

We will do, thank you. Please find your proforma invoice attached.
Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Thu, 24 Jun 2021 at 08:44, mlinke www.mlinke.eu < sklep@mariuszlinke.pl> wrote:

Hello Ryan ;)
At beginning I send you big smile ;)

Thank you very much.

Next time in such a situation, please contact me before sending the package - I
will definitely add something else to it.

Please send me the invoice and I will make the payment.

Best regards,
mlinke ;)

www.mlinke.eu
sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount
tel. 0048 793 540 230

Wystaw opinie o naszej firmie w Google tutaj: dodaj opinie!
Pomysl o srodowisku! Nie drukuj tej wiadomosci jesli nie jest to konieczne.

Ta wiadomos¢ e-mail jest wolna od wiruséw i ztosliwego oprogramowania,
poniewaz ochrona ESET NOD32 Antivirus jest aktywna.

ESET NOD32

Otrzymana wiadomos$¢ jest poufna i stanowi tajemnice przedsigbiorstwa. Nie wolno jej
ujawnia¢ osobom trzecim.

This message is confidential and a business secret. The contents may not be disclosed to third
parties.

23 czerwca 2021 16:55 Ryan Swaine < office@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):

Hi Mariusz

As | mentioned yesterday, we were too late to add the additional 5x R-17VAN
sensors.

With regards to postage costs; | apologise but we have to charge the postage for
part shipped orders. However, as a good will gesture, we will add a separate order
for the 5x R-17VAN and we will cover the postage costs, | hope this is ok with you.
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Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Wed, 23 Jun 2021 at 11:50, mlinke www.mlinke.eu < sklep@mariuszlinke.pl>
wrote:

Hello Ryan :)
At beginning I send you big smile ;)

What about my order? Did you send it together? I don't
received any answer from you.

Best regards,
mlinke ;)

www.mlinke.eu
sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount
tel. 0048 793 540 230

Wystaw opinie o naszej firmie w Google tutaj: dodaj opinie!

Pomysl o srodowisku! Nie drukuj tej wiadomosci jesli nie jest to
konieczne.

Ta wiadomos$¢ e-mail jest wolna od wirusow i zto$liwego
oprogramowania,
poniewaz ochrona ESET NOD32 Antivirus jest aktywna.

ESET NOD32

Otrzymana wiadomos$¢ jest poufna i stanowi tajemnice
przedsiebiorstwa. Nie wolno jej ujawnia¢ osobom trzecim.

This message is confidential and a business secret. The contents
may not be disclosed to third parties.

22 czerwca 2021 11:19 Ryan Swaine <
office@viamed.co.uk> napisat(a):

Hi Mariusz

Please accept my reply, as Gail is tied up with packing
orders today and not monitoring her emails.
Unfortunately your current order has been packed and
postage has been added, so it's not possible to amend
it without destroying the packaging and the postage
stamps.

Do you want to place a separate order for the 5x R-
17VAN or wait until you require more items?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Tue, 22 Jun 2021 at 09:53, mlinke www.mlinke.eu <
sklep@mariuszlinke.pl> wrote:

Hello Gail ;)
At beginning I send you big smile

!

Is it possible to add to package R-
17 sensor - 5 pcs?
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Please let me know. If yes, send
me invocie. I will make payment.

Best regards,
mlinke ;)

www.mlinke.eu
sklep@mariuszlinke.pl

facebook: mlinke sidemount
tel. 0048 793 540 230

Wystaw opini¢ o naszej firmie w Google
tutaj: dodaj opinie!

Pomysl o Srodowisku! Nie drukuj tej
wiadomosci jesli nie jest to konieczne.

Ta wiadomos¢ e-mail jest wolna od
wiruséw i ztosliwego oprogramowania,
poniewaz ochrona ESET NOD32
Antivirus jest aktywna.

ESET NOD32

Otrzymana wiadomos¢ jest poufna i
stanowi tajemnice przedsiebiorstwa. Nie
wolno jej ujawnia¢ osobom trzecim.
This message is confidential and a
business secret. The contents may not
be disclosed to third parties.

22 czerwca 2021 10:34
Gail Bell <
office@viamed.co.uk>
napisat(a):

Dear Mariusz Linke,

| am writing to inform you
that your order,
26042186GB has been
dispatched.

You can track your order
reference 26042186GB on
the , with the following
tracking number
RV920490081GB.

Please see attached
delivery note, DAN130047-
2 and a copy of your
invoice, RAN130047-2.

Kind Regards
Gail Bell

Vandagraph Ltd
gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
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