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Re: Adapter- Requirement
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Vinyas Electronics <sales@vinyaselectronics.in> 30 September 2021 at 15:58
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate, 

Can you pls remove the Fright charges, you can book in our fedex account. 

and if you need Envitech -OOM202 we can able to give at $25.00 Let me know if you needed. DC Aug 2021.

Regards
Vinoth 

On 09/30/2021 7:53 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good afternoon Vinoth,

Please see attached proforma invoice as requested.  Please let me know if you require any changes to be made.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and I am now working remotely.
Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Thu, 30 Sept 2021 at 11:46, Vinyas Electronics <sales@vinyaselectronics.in> wrote:



Dear Kate,

Please find the Invoice and delivery address with IEC code,

VINYAS ELECTRONICS
NO 29C SHIVA VISHNU AVENUE,KANNIVAKKAM


GUDUVANCHERY,KANCHIPURAM,KANCHIPURAM,TAMIL


NADU,603202.

IEC Code : FELPS9485H

Contact Person : Raj kumar 
Phone : 9043890468

Regards,

Vinoth

On 09/30/2021 4:07 PM Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Vinoth,

Ryan Swaine has asked me to issue you with a proforma invoice for 1 x 0120106.  In order to do so, I would need your delivery
and invoice addresses so I can set up a new account.

We are able to accept payment by bank transfer and PayPal (this incurs a 6% fee of the total order).  We are unable to accept
credit card payments.

I await your reply.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths
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