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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Quotation Needed
1 message

MUHY-AL-DIN AL-LABBAN <mehedden@yahoo.com> 30 September 2021 at 11:56
To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: "zk01@aub.edu.lb" <zk01@aub.edu.lb>, Ml26 <ml26@aub.edu.lb>

Dear Ms. Griffiths,

We will need 3 units. Please send us a quotation with all charges.

All the best


Mehedden Labban

Electrical Engineer

Tel: +9613914236

P Please consider the environment. Do you really need to print this email?

On Thursday, September 30, 2021, 01:23:20 PM GMT+3, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Good morning Mehedden,

Thank you for your email.

Please could I ask how many R-22MED (0110021) you require?  I can then issue a proforma invoice (or quotation if
you prefer) showing carriage charge, bank charges and insurance.

According to our cross reference, the R-22MED is compatible to Analytical Industries 11-39. 

The price breaks are as follows:

1 = $ 63.50 2 = $ 57.15 each EXW 3 - 10 = $ 53.98 each EXW 11 or more = $ 50.80 each EXW

Many thanks.


Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.


http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

On Thu, 30 Sept 2021 at 10:39, MUHY-AL-DIN AL-LABBAN <mehedden@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Ms. Griffiths,


Can you please send us your best price offer for the R-22MED sensor with shipping
charges to Beirut, Lebanon.
Is this a replacement to Analytical Industries 54019-2/XLT-11-39-2


All the best



Mehedden Labban

Electrical Engineer

Tel: +9613914236
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