29/09/2021, 13:53 Gmail - Fwd: Hoods

M Gma” Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

Fwd: Hoods

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 29 September 2021 at 13:36

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@vmsecure.me.uk>

Hi Sarah

Please can you pop this order on and stick it on an 8, | will have to speak with Steve at some point and see if we can
still do this. We did offer to do them back in January.

Thanks
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Unba AptemoB <iartemov@servinst.ru>
Date: Tue, 28 Sept 2021 at 16:49

Subject: Re: Hoods

To: Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sirs.

Currently we are ready to order hoods. Please see our order enclosed, send us official
proforma and start manufacturing.

Please inform as well planned weight and volume to check and decide about delivery way to
Russia.

Best regards, Ilia

Hi Ilya

I have had confirmation that we can still purchase the materials and supply the PP8533 hoods
(non CE Certified), but the price of the materials has increased, the new price would be USD
$171.70 each EXW - Delivery would be approximately 6 weeks from receipt of order.

With regards to the MX300, Teledyne have stopped manufacture, but we have 10x left in stock.
Unfortunately these were also purchased at a higher price that Teledyne introduced at the
beginning of the year:

MX300 - 0111235 = USD $450.00 each EXW

Please let me know how you would like to proceed?

Best regards
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Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager

VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, 25 Jan 2021 at 19:39, Ilya Artemov <iartemov@servinst.ru> wrote:

OrnpasjyieHo ¢ iPhone

Hauajyio nepeanpeCoOBaHHOTO COOOWEHMS:

Or: Mnbs ApreMoB <iartemov@servinst.ru>
HJara: 24 guBaps 2021 r. B 16:06:55 GMT+3
Komy: Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Kommsa: Sarah Walton <officel@viamed.co.uk>
Tema: Hoods

Dear Ryan and Sarah.

We plan to take again hoods and 02 monitors. Last time you told us
that if we take 50 pcs of hoods we can order.

Therefore I enclose here our request, please check and confirm us such
prices and quantities, after that we will send you official order.

Best regards, Ilia

C yBaxeHMeM,

nbsa mailto:iartemov@servinst.ru
C ysaxeHuem,
Unbs mailto:iartemov@servinst.ru
@ Viamed.xls
38K
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