28/09/2021, 10:44 Gmail - RE: RFQ 6607

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
RE: RFQ 6607

1 message

Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com> 28 September 2021 at 09:27

To: "kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk" <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Coordinator1 <coordinator1@wagdlife.com>, Sandra <coordinator2@wagdlife.com>, yahya kalaf
<account@wagdlife.com>, e 2as <info@wagdlife.com>

Dear Kate,

Kindly see below Billing address & Shipping address. Both are different. | hope you have quote for original Max250

Billing address:

Wagd Al Hayyat Est.

Unique Pearl Il Business Center

Al Shola Building (Al Naboodah, E-Block)
Office # 7, Second Floor

Near DCC - Metro, Exit# 4

Diera, Dubai

Contact Person:: Mohammed Nayeem

Contact Number: +971 52 985 9108

Shipping Address:

Wagd Life Medicals Co.

Attn: Mohammed ISA

Mobile: +966-568704040
Hamza Bin Abdul Mutlib Steet
Exit 26, Suwaidi,

Riyadh, Saudi Arabia

P.O. Box: 153264

Thanks and Best Regards,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1711345495233891383%7Cmsg-f%3A171213343... 1/16
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Mohammed Nayeem
Wagd Al Hayyat Est.
Mobile: +971529859108
Dubai, UAE.
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www.wagdlife.com

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Tuesday, September 28, 2021 12:16 PM

To: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ 6607

Thank you Mohammed,

If you require a proforma invoice detailing bank charges, carriage charge and insurance, | would need your delivery
and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 28 Sept 2021 at 09:14, Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Kindly send us Proforma Invoice with 10 each for both the items.

Please advise us how many connector right now you have in stock.

For Freight we will use our DHL to ship this order once we make payment

Kindly send full bank details ASAP.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Mohammed Nayeem
Wagd Al Hayyat Est.
Mobile: +971529859108
Dubai, UAE.
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Tuesday, September 28, 2021 11:59 AM

To: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ 6607

Hi Mohammed,

The oxygen sensor 0110432 - MAX-250(B) is currently in stock. We have a few of the connectors in stock
currently, but as many as you need.

We would ship as soon as possible after payment is received if stock is still available.

If you require a proforma invoice detailing bank charges, carriage charge and insurance, | would need your
delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but
please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Tue, 28 Sept 2021 at 05:52, Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Please advise if you have stock for the oxygen sensor. How long would it take if you will ship it to Saudi
Arabia?

Thanks and Best Regards,

Mohammed Nayeem
Wagd Al Hayyat Est.
Mobile: +971529859108

Dubai, UAE.
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www.wagdlife.com
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths
Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 4:40 PM

To: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ 6607

Hi Mohammed,

Part number 0131527 - connector 3 pole black socket 1mm costs $5.45 each EXW. Please see my email of
September 20th.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely,
but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be
taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply
with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Mon, 27 Sept 2021 at 13:34, Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Please can you send me price for Connector.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Mohammed Nayeem
Wagd Al Hayyat Est.
Mobile: +971529859108

Dubai, UAE.
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www.wagdlife.com

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Giriffiths
Sent: Monday, September 27, 2021 1:38 PM

To: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ 6607

Good morning Mohammed,

Unfortunately, we are unable to solder the connector for you. The lead time could be as long as 8-10
weeks.

Many thanks.

Kind regards
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Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from
home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered
remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to
be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Sun, 26 Sept 2021 at 13:52, Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Kindly advise us. If we order this Oxygen sensor how many week it will take to ship. And please we
would like to know about the Connector Soldered it will be done from your side.

Thanks and Best Regards,

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1711345495233891383%7Cmsg-f%3A171213343... 8/16
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Mohammed Nayeem
Wagd Al Hayyat Est.
Mobile: +971529859108
Dubai, UAE.
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www.wagdlife.com

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Giriffiths
Sent: Thursday, September 23, 2021 4:13 PM

To: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ 6607

Good afternoon Mohammed,

The connector needs to be soldered in place, then it will be the same as the item in your photograph. |
hope this helps.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered
remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted
to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please
reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 23 Sept 2021 at 12:15, Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Date: Thu, 23 Sept 2021 at 12:14

Subject: RE: RFQ 6607

To: viamedinbox@gmail.com <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
Cc: Coordinator1 <coordinator1@wagdlife.com>

Dear Kate,

Kindly confirm for we can connect 2 parts and make the same Oxygen sensor with connector.

Thanks and Best Regards,

Mohammed Nayeem
Wagd Al Hayyat Est.
Mobile: +971529859108
Dubai, UAE.
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Giriffiths
Sent: Monday, September 20, 2021 4:30 PM

To: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ 6607

Hi Mohammed,

We are no longer able to sell the sensor with the connector attached, but the parts | listed: 0110432 &
0131527 make up the item in your photograph. | am sorry about the lead time, but wanted to let you
know ahead of any order you might place.

| hope this helps.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work
from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=b5871a5be0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1711345495233891383%7Cmsg-f%3A17121334... 11/16


http://www.wagdlife.com/
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:coordinator@wagdlife.com
http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd

28/09/2021, 10:44 Gmail - RE: RFQ 6607
Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Mon, 20 Sept 2021 at 13:19, Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com> wrote:

Dear Kate,

Please see below. We need same one as shown in this image. Kindly confirm us. SO that we will
check.

And the delivery period is so long.
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Thanks and Best Regards,

Mohammed Nayeem
Wagd Al Hayyat Est.
Mobile: +971529859108
Dubai, UAE.

www.wagdlife.com

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Giriffiths
Sent: Monday, September 20, 2021 4:11 PM

To: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Subject: Re: RFQ 6607

Good afternoon Mohammed,

Thank you for your enquiry. We can offer you part numbers 0110432 - oxygen sensor MAX-250(B)
at $73.50 each EXW with part number 0131527 - connector 3 pole black socket 1mm costing
$5.45 each EXW.
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Part number 0131527 - connector 3 pole black socket 1mm would have a lead time of 8-10
weeks.

If you require a proforma invoice detailing bank charges, carriage charge and insurance, | would
need your delivery and invoice addresses in order to set up a new account for you.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or
omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list,
please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
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On Sun, 19 Sept 2021 at 16:44, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Coordinator <coordinator@wagdlife.com>

Date: Sun, 19 Sept 2021 at 12:46

Subject: RFQ 6607

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>, enquiries@viamed.co.uk
<enquiries@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Coordinator1 <coordinator1@wagdlife.com>, Sandra <coordinator2@wagdlife.com>

Dear Sir,

Please quote for the requested item below. Same as shown in below image.

R125P02-003 - N2191/10| OXYGEN CELL for SLE 5000

Note: with Connector

QTY: 10
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Thanks and Best Regards,

Mohammed Nayeem
Wagd Al Hayyat Est.
Mobile: +971529859108

Dubai, UAE.
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