27/09/2021, 11:21 Gmail - Re: R-33S1

M Gma” Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Re: R-33$1

2 messages

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 27 September 2021 at 11:08

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Deepstop <shop@deepstop.de>
Cc: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>, Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Dear Hans
Yes, there is stock available. We will add an order for an additional 5, so you will receive 6 sensors in total.

Thank you
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

On Mon, 27 Sept 2021 at 06:26, Deepstop <shop@deepstop.de> wrote:
Hello Ryan, are more in stock now? If yes, please ship 6x if not repost 1, thanks!

Am 24.09.2021 um 16:26 schrieb Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>:
Dear Hans

| hope you are well.

We have received one of your orders back in the post, it relates to an order placed at the beginning of
August for 1x R-33S1 sensor (invoice and picture of the parcel attached).

Please can you let me know how you would like to proceed:

1) Re-post the sensor with Airmail
2) Add it to your next order
3) Do not send the sensor and credit the invoice

We will await your reply.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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27/09/2021, 11:21 Gmail - Re: R-33S1
Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 27 September 2021 at 11:10
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>
Cc: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>
Hi Galil
This relates to the parcel that was returned, RAN131942-1.
Please add an order for the 5 x R-33S1 and send them with the 1x R-33S1 that was returned.
Thank you
Ryan
Ryan Swaine
VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk
Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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