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Re: Shipment

1 message

Sudath Weeraman <sudathweeraman17@gmail.com> 27 September 2021 at 06:21
To: Sarah Walton <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Sarah,
Please send new Proforma invoice for 20 Pcs MAX 250E & 20 Pcs (4 Boxes) Flow sensors,
The bank is limit the overseas payment through Credit Card, therefore we will plan to send payment via TT

Made a proforma invoice in GBP and package collected from Skycargo.

Best regards,

Sudath Weeraman
Prime Lanka Associates
Sri Lanka.

On Fri, Sep 10, 2021, 7:01 PM Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Sudath,

Just wanted to let you know that we are still waiting to hear from your freight forwarder regarding your latest shipment.
Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.
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It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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