22/09/2021, 15:26 Gmail - Fwd: Website question re Carefusion

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: Website question re Carefusion

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 22 September 2021 at 15:24

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Diego Julian Gorvein <dgorvein@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 22 Sept 2021 at 15:08

Subject: Re: Website question re Carefusion

To: <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

In Voice Address:

Clinica GUGGIARI S.A
Republica Dominicana 1002
Asuncion - Paraguay

RUC: 80098741-1

Delivery Address:

Diego Julian Gorvein (GB 32562)

MIAMI

8578 NW 70th Street.

Miami, Florida

Zip Code: 33195 — 2671 Phone: (1-305) 593 - 6888

Hello, let me know when | can make the payment by Pay Pal
Thanks
Greetings

Libre de virus. www.avast.com

El mar, 21 sept 2021 a las 9:01, Sophie Lines (<office@viamed.co.uk>) escribid:
Dear Diego,

Thank you for your update, | look forward to hearing from you again soon

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
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If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited
and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call
+44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Mon, Sep 20, 2021 at 5:50 PM Diego Julian Gorvein <dgorvein@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello Sophie, sorry for the delay, | will give you the information for the invoice shortly

El mar, 7 sept 2021 a las 6:53, Sophie Lines (<office@viamed.co.uk>) escribio:
Dear Diego,

Please find attached a Proforma Invoice for 2x 0110081 (UFO 130-2 Oxygen Sensors). | have used the
same addresses as given previously - however please let me know if you would like to amend these.

| note you previously paid via PayPal - if you would prefer this method of payment again, please let me know
and | will amend the Proforma Invoice accordingly. If not, our details for payment via Bank Transfer can be
found at the bottom of the invoice.

| look forward to hearing from you.

Kind regards

Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
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On Tue, Sep 7, 2021 at 11:04 AM Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Dear Diego,

Thank you for your email. | will prepare a Proforma Invoice for 2x 0110081 (UFO 130-2 Oxygen Sensors)
with courier charges to Paraguay - please can you confirm whether the delivery and invoice addresses are
the same as your previous order from 20187

Kind regards

Sophie Lines
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Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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On Tue, Sep 7, 2021 at 7:01 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Diego Julian Gorvein <dgorvein@gmail.com>
Date: Mon, 6 Sept 2021 at 20:35

Subject: Re: Website question re Carefusion

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hello, | need two sensors n ° 0110081( UFO 130-2 Oxygen Sensor)
What is the value, with shipping to Paraguay
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