16/09/2021, 15:25 Gmail - Fwd: Order from Meditsiinigrupp

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: Order from Meditsiinigrupp

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 September 2021 at 15:12

Reply-To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Please can we process the order that is currently on as an 8.
Thank you

Ryan

Ryan Swaine - Viamed & Vandagraph - +44 (0) 7803 907117
---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ago Kiinnapaa <ago@meditsiinigrupp.ee>

Date: Thu, 16 Sep 2021, 13:59

Subject: Order from Meditsiinigrupp
To: Ryan Swaine (ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk) <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan,

Sorry for my late answer. Yes, i accept blender with Maxtec label. Please send goods a.s.a.p.

Best regards,

Ago Klnnapaa
Sales Manager
Meditsiinigrupp Ltd,

Estonia

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine
Sent: Friday, September 10, 2021 12:38 PM

To: Ago Kilinnapaa <ago@meditsiinigrupp.ee>

Subject: Re: Order from Meditsiinigrupp
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Hi Ago

Do you have any news regarding my previous email?

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 2 Sept 2021 at 13:00, Ryan Swaine <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk> wrote:
Hi Ago

| am very sorry for the late response on this. As | mentioned before Precision had to withdraw from the market
when their notified body (Lloyds) decided to stop working in the medical industry. We believe they will be able to
start supplying again in the near future, but there is no definitive date, so until then we can supply the same
blenders but with a Maxtec label. Unfortunately Maxtec have decided to increase the pricing.

Please can you take a look at the attached order confirmation, | have not made it live on our system yet, | will
wait for your confirmation. Carriage cost would be added to the invoice at the point of dispatch. | have added
insurance, but you are not obliged to have this if you would prefer not to.

| have added a picture of the items below:
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| will await your reply before we proceed with the order and please let me know if you have any questions.
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Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Tue, 17 Aug 2021 at 13:56, Ago Kiinnapaa <ago@meditsiinigrupp.ee> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
How are you.

Please accept our order.
Best regards,

Ago Kiinnapaa

Sales Manager

Meditsiinigrupp Ltd,

Estonia
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