16/09/2021, 13:50 Gmail - Re: Quote and Price

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Re: Quote and Price

1 message

Enrique Bond <enriquebond@gmail.com> 16 September 2021 at 13:42

To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Kate. My other email address is Hernandezenrique@live.com
And company name Importadora Nuevo Mundo S.A from Nicaragua.

The last purchase was a oxygen sensors.
Right now | have a problem with my other email. Sorry
Regards,

Enrique

El 16 sep. 2021, a la(s) 06:36, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> escribio:

Hi Enrique,

Please could | ask if you have purchased from us before? From your recent email address, | am
unable to link you to an account.

If you haven't purchased from us before, | would need your invoice and delivery addresses in order to
set up a new account for you.

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to
work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be
answered remotely, but please continue to use email where possible.
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On Thu, 16 Sept 2021 at 13:25, Enrique Bond <enriquebond@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello. Kate.

We need the price and delivery time for 4 units.
Could you asking if the language can be changed to Spanish. Pls.
Thanks,

Enrique

El 16 sep. 2021, a la(s) 04:23, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> escribio:

Good morning Enrique,
Thank you for your enquiry.

We have an alcotrue kit, part number 4710031, please see manual and leaflet. You
would need to go through the specifications to see if it is suitable.

Please note that the printer is wired - NOT Bluetooth. You will see that the range is
from 0.00 to 5.5 g/l. The device is set for mg/l by default, other units can be selected
by authorised personnel. The default language is English.

If you do decide to purchase the device, you would need to let us know what defaults
you require.

| am unable to say if the certificates are suitable for your customer:

EN 15964:2011 certified, EN 55011:2007, EN 61326:2006, IEC 60068-2-6:2007, IEC
60068-2-27:2008, IEC 60068-2-64:2008,

IEC 68-2-32:1975 + A1/A2:1980, EN 60529:1991 +A1:2000

Many thanks.
Kind regards
Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and
admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone
calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please continue to use
email where possible.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
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unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any
action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be
unlawful.
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Gmail - Re: Quote and Price

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our
mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, 15 Sept 2021 at 15:18, Enrique Bond <enriquebond@gmail.com> wrote:
Could you quote this kind of Alcohol Sensor with this or better specification.

Thanks for your prompt respond,

Enrique
<AlcoTrue Alcohol Meters Instructions for Use User Manual - AlcoTrue M
ID48595.pdf>
<AlcoTrue M Breathalyser Leaflet ID18091 (1).pdf>
<AlcoTrue M Breathalyser Technical Specification Sheet ID17804.pdf>
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