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M Gma” Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Request quotation

4 messages

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Sep 15, 2021 at 5:19 PM

Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: purchase@damarus.com

Dear Maria,
Thank you for your email.

We would be happy to supply you with a new Foetal Heart Simulator model V1000. The price is $950.00 per unit
EXW.

Please note there is a delay for this product of approximately 8-10 weeks.
If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Purchasing Damarus <purchase@damarus.com>
Date: Wed, 15 Sept 2021 at 12:27

Subject: request quoation

To: <info@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: <ehaliman21@gmail.com>

Dear Ms,
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We are Indonesia company distributor of Medical Equipment

One of the products is FETAL SIMULATOR

We read that your products V 1000 Foeta Head Monitors , suitable for technician, midwives , clinicals etc.

We interest to order 1 unit as demo and trial unit
Please send quotation ... FOB UK, advice discount and gross weight

Thank you for your attention

Regards

Maria Phoa

Product Manager
PT Damarus Panen Utama
JI. Kaji No. 51
Jakarta 10130 Indonesia
Phone : 62-21 6312222
Fax : 62-21-6321080
purchase@damarus.com
www.damarus.com

www.moisturemeter.co.id

Purchasing Damarus <purchase@damarus.com>
To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
Cc: phoamaria@gmail.com

Dear Zoey Teal .

Thank you for your information.

Thu, Sep 16, 2021 at 1:31 AM

May | reconfirm that the price is US$950.00 (Us Dollar) notin British poundsterling.

We interest , may we get discount ?

Could you send the official pro forma invoice with bank detail or you can accept another method of payment .

Looking forward to receive your reply soonest .

Best regards

Maria Phoa

[Quoted text hidden]

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Thu, Sep 16, 2021 at 7:44 AM

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=77e4056450&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-a%3Ar2025309992766948212&simpl=msg-a%3Ar-3441... 2/3


mailto:purchase@damarus.com
http://www.damarus.com/
http://www.moisturemeter.co.id/

16/09/2021, 13:35 Gmail - Request quotation

To: Purchasing Damarus <purchase@damarus.com>
Cc: phoamaria@gmail.com

Dear Maria,

Thank you for your reply.

| can confirm that it is $950 USD.

Please can you confirm if you are only wanting to purchase one?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

[Quoted text hidden]

Maria Phoa <phoamaria@gmail.com> Thu, Sep 16, 2021 at 9:29 AM

To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Yes .Justone .. .. we will see after receivedit ..regards Maria
[Quoted text hidden]
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