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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Re: Asking for O2 sensor for Carefusion Vmax

1 message

Adolfo Salvatierra <adolfsalv@yahoo.com.ar> 15 September 2021 at 11:30
To: kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Good Morning. Kate.
This Time the invoice address Will be: 

Jorge B Morano
Under Haus (front of Marshall Mall)
233 Charles de Gaulla st
Asuncion Villa Morra
Asuncion, 1849
Paraguay (PY)

We already ordered to Paraguay a couple of years ago. 

UPS shipped to Paraguay.

El miércoles, 15 de septiembre de 2021 07:12:16 ART, Kate Griffiths <office@viamed.co.uk> escribió:

Good morning Adolfo,

Thank you for your order.

Please could I confirm that the invoice address is as follows:

Ana Paula Salvatierra, Carrer de Mallorca 536, 08026, Barcelona, Spain?

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home,
and I am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main office will be answered remotely, but please
continue to use email where possible.
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On Wed, 15 Sept 2021 at 10:25, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:




---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Adolfo Salvatierra <adolfsalv@yahoo.com.ar>

Date: Tue, 14 Sept 2021 at 20:39

Subject: Re: Asking for O2 sensor for Carefusion Vmax

To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>





Dear Zoey
. Here is my order for UFO 130-2 sensor 




5x             UFO 130-2 Sensors


Ship to


Jorge B Morano
Under Haus (front of Marshall Mall)
233 Charles de Gaulla st
Asuncion Villa Morra
Asuncion, 1849
Paraguay (PY)




I will pay in US dollars via Paypal, From my account


I will stay in touch for your answer


Thank you


Dr Adolfo Salvatierra


























El martes, 3 de agosto de 2021 03:48:57 ART, Zoey Teal <office@viamed.co.uk> escribió:




Dear Adolfo, 


Please can you confirm your full invoice and delivery address so I can send you an official proforma to show
these costs? 



If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.



Kind regards
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