13/09/2021, 10:15

M Gmail

Fwd: R-23V SENSOR

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Divya Chandran <divya@navigamedical.com>

Date: Sun, 12 Sept 2021 at 08:25
Subject: R-23V SENSOR

To: office@viamed.co.uk <office@viamed.co.uk>
Cc: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Dear Kate ,

Good day ,

Greetings from Naviga medical ,

Gmail - Fwd: R-23V SENSOR

Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

12 September 2021 at 15:34

Could you please provide us the invoice of R-23 V sensor- 10 units {OXYGEN SENSOR R-23V FOR DRAEGER

EVITA XL } with shipping cost .

Looking forward to hear from you.

Best regards ,

Divya Sharma
Product Specialist
Mob  : +973 — 33629448

Tel: : +973 - 17112344

Fax: : 973 - 17583324

Web:  : www.navigamedical.com
Kingdom of Bahrain
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