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Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: Quote for O2 Sensor

1 message

Jake Foad <j.foad@griffininstitute.org.uk>
To: "sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk" <sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Sarah,

 

Our finance department contact is Bremavathy Mahendran
b.mahendran@griffininstitute.org.uk

 

I have also attached a VAT Exemption certificate.

 

 

Thanks,

 

Jake Foad

Research Theatre Technician
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The Griffin Institute is the brand name of

Northwick Park Institute for Medical Research

(NPIMR), a company limited by guarantee

No. 3445616 and Registered Charity No. 1129348.

 

 

Join us on 9th May 2021, for a fun, family-friendly walk across 10 iconic London Bridges.
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From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: 08 September 2021 07:22

To: Jake Foad <j.foad@griffininstitute.org.uk>

Subject: Re: Quote for O2 Sensor

 

Hi Jake,

 

I will need to set an account up on our system for your first.  Please can you provide me with the following information?

We will need an email address for accounts and for where the invoices need to be emailed to, if different.


Do you pay VAT or are you exempt? If you are exempt, we will need a VAT exemption certificate attached with every order placed.

 

Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered. 

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to
www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------
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Hi,

 

COuld I go ahead and order 3, please? I have attached the PO form.

 

 

Thanks,

 

Jake Foad
Research Theater Technician
 

 
To support us, please visit www.charityextra.com/savinglives
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The Griffin Institute is the brand name of

Northwick Park Institute for Medical Research

(NPIMR), a company limited by guarantee

No. 3445616 and Registered Charity No. 1129348.

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
on behalf of Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk>

Sent: 25 August 2021 10:20

To: Jake Foad <j.foad@griffininstitute.org.uk>

Subject: Re: Quote for O2 Sensor

 

Dear Jake,

 

Thank you for your email.

 

We have quantity discounts for the R-30V sensor, please see below.

1 = £54.00,  2 = £51.30,  3 - 10 = £48.60 and 11+ = £45.90. These prices are excluding VAT.

Carriage is free.




Kind regards

 

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered. 

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

 

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email
sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy  

 

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to
www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter:
twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page:
facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK 

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance
on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Jake Foad <j.foad@griffininstitute.org.uk>

Date: Wed, 25 Aug 2021 at 10:02
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Subject: Quote for O2 Sensor

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Chantelle West <c.west@griffininstitute.org.uk>, Flora Sands <f.sands@griffininstitute.org.uk>

 

Hi,

 

Could I get a quote for the R-30V Oxygen Sensor- 0110040

 

 

Thanks,

 

Jake Foad
Research Theater Technician
 

 
To support us, please
visit www.charityextra.com/savinglives

T
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The Griffin Institute
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Y Block, Watford Road Harrow,
HA1 3UJ

The Griffin Institute is
the brand name of

Northwick Park Institute
for Medical Research

(NPIMR), a company limited
by guarantee

No. 3445616 and Registered
Charity No. 1129348.
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