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M Gmail Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: payment attached

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk>
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, 10 Sept 2021 at 09:11

Subject: Fwd: payment attached

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Kate
I am happy for this to go, they are in a hurry for them.

Thanks
Ryan

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Medical Corp-Achizitii <achiziti@medicalcorp.ro>

Date: Fri, 10 Sept 2021 at 08:56

Subject: payment attached

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>, <ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk>

Dear Kate,

Thank you for your e-mail! @
Please find attached our payment.
| am waiting news about delivery date.

Have a nice weekend!

Cu deosebit respect / Best regards,
Mrs. Claudia Damian

purchasing manager
A "4 N\

MedicalCorp

iin spiritul medicined. Din 1898

Romania, 550165 Sibiu, Str. Ghe. Lazar nr. 8

GSM / WhatsApp (+4)0728.030.738

Tel: (+4)0269.232.673; (+4)0369.447.835; (+4)0269.245.532; int 22;

Fax: (+4)0269.232.673; (+4)0369.447.835; (+4)0269.245.532; int 14;

E-mail address: achiziti@medicalcorp.ro

www.medicalcorp.ro  www.medicalshop.ro

Importator aparatura medicala: monitoare pacient, electrocardiografe, holter EKG, ecografe, spirometre, audiometre, aparate aerosoli, oftalmoscoape, defibrilatoare, autoclave, electrocautere, cc
Service pentru orice tip de echipament medical.

(RO) Acest e-mail a fost transmis de catre Medical Corp SRL. Informatiile din acest mesaj sunt confidentiale si pot fi protejate prin lege. Prezentul mesaj este transmis in atentia exclusiva a desting

dumneavoastra.
(EN) This email has been sent from Medical Corp SRL. The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by any

Before printing this document, think about the environment!

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Kate Griffiths

Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 3:23 PM

To: Medical Corp-Achizitii <achiziti@medicalcorp.ro>; ryan.swaine@vmsecure.me.uk
Subject: Re: new order
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Good afternoon Claudia,

Thank you for your order.

Please see attached proforma invoice as requested.

Please let me know if you require any changes to be made. Ryan has emailed you the certificates you require.

Many thanks.

Kind regards

Kate Griffiths

Viamed is now enacting a coronavirus contingency plan to allow sales and admin staff to work from home, and | am now working remotely. Telephone calls to the main

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, 9 Sept 2021 at 09:18, Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi, Please can we send a proforma to Claudia ASAP.

Thank you,

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542

Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Medical Corp-Achizitii <achiziti@medicalcorp.ro>
Date: Thu, 9 Sept 2021 at 08:38

Subject: new order

To: <ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk>
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Dear Ryan,

How are you today? | hope you are well. @)
Please help me with the following order:
Code 4310002 - 30 sets

I am waiting the Pl to arrange the payment asap, because we need these in two weeks.

Can you support us with a fast delivery?
Also, please send me the Ce Certificate / Decalaration of Conformity... because from this year we have to arrange customs procedure for any buying from England.
Thank you for your support!

Cu deosebit respect / Best regards,

Mrs. Claudia Damian

purchasing manager

MedicalCorp

iin spiritul medicinei. Din 1898

Romania, 550165 Sibiu, Str. Ghe. Lazar nr. 8

GSM / WhatsApp (+4)0728.030.738

Tel: (+4)0269.232.673; (+4)0369.447.835; (+4)0269.245.532; int 22;

Fax: (+4)0269.232.673; (+4)0369.447.835; (+4)0269.245.532; int 14;

E-mail address: achiziti@medicalcorp.ro

www.medicalcorp.ro  www.medicalshop.ro

Importator aparatura medicala: monitoare pacient, electrocardiografe, holter EKG, ecografe, spirometre, audiometre, aparate aerosoli, oftalmoscoape, defibrilatoare, autoclave, electrocautere
Service pentru orice tip de echipament medical.

(RO) Acest e-mail a fost transmis de catre Medical Corp SRL. Informatiile din acest mesaj sunt confidentiale si pot fi protejate prin lege. Prezentul mesaj este transmis in atentia exclusiva a dest
dumneavoastra.

(EN) This email has been sent from Medical Corp SRL. The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged. It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by ¢

Before printing this document, think about the environment!
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