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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: QUOTATION

1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 6 September 2021 at 09:18
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

R-17VAN

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br>

Date: Fri, 3 Sept 2021 at 20:49

Subject: RES: QUOTATION

To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Cc: <luc@totalmat.com.br>


 

Hi Ryan,

 

Please send me a proforma with 21 units, and bank details for payment.

 

Thanks.
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SEE THE NEW TOTALMAT WEBSITE WITH ONLINE CATALOG www.totalmat.com

Iago de Jesus
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R Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282 - Socorro
CEP: 04763-000, São Paulo/SP - Brasil

iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br

IMCA member     

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine

Enviada em: sexta-feira, 6 de agosto de 2021 11:09

Para: Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br>

Assunto: Re: QUOTATION

 

Dear Iago

 

Yes, we have plenty of stock available. Would you like me to send you a proforma for 11 pieces?

 

Best regards

Ryan

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Fri, 6 Aug 2021 at 14:03, Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br> wrote:

Correct, it's the R-17VAN, do you have it in stock?

 

Thanks.

 

VEJA O NOVO SITE DA TOTALMAT COM CATALOGO ONLINE  www.totalmat.com.br
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Iago de Jesus
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Comercial/Vendas - Commercial / Sales

TOTALMAT Industria e Comercio de
Equipamentos Hiperbáricos Ltda 

 

Cell Phone: +55 (11) 99373-4683

Phone: +55 (11) 5524-3918

live:iago.jesus93

 

R Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282 - Socorro
CEP: 04763-000, São Paulo/SP - Brasil

iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br

IMCA member     

 

 

De: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> Em nome de Ryan Swaine

Enviada em: sexta-feira, 6 de agosto de 2021 08:04

Para: Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br>

Assunto: Re: QUOTATION

 

Thank you Iago

 

Is it the R-17VAN you require? If so, the trade price is GBP £35 each EXW

 

Best regards

Ryan

 




Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117
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On Fri, 6 Aug 2021 at 11:18, Iago - Totalmat <iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

Please give me price for 11 O2 sensor units.

 

Thanks.

 

VEJA O NOVO SITE DA TOTALMAT COM CATALOGO ONLINE  www.totalmat.com.br

SEE THE NEW TOTALMAT WEBSITE WITH ONLINE CATALOG www.totalmat.com

Iago de Jesus

Comercial/Vendas - Commercial / Sales

TOTALMAT Industria e Comercio de
Equipamentos Hiperbáricos Ltda 

 

Cell Phone: +55 (11) 99373-4683

Phone: +55 (11) 5524-3918

live:iago.jesus93

 

R Augusto Ferreira de Morais, 282 - Socorro
CEP: 04763-000, São Paulo/SP - Brasil

iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br

IMCA member     

 

 

mailto:iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br
http://www.totalmat.com.br/
http://www.totalmat.com/
https://www.google.com/maps/search/R+Augusto+Ferreira+de+Morais,+282+-+Socorro+CEP:+04763-000,+S%C3%A3o+Paulo%2FSP+-+Brasil?entry=gmail&source=g
mailto:iago.jesus@totalmat.com.br

