02/09/2021 Gmail - Fwd: Invoice for service Nottingham City NHS

M Gma" Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>
Fwd: Invoice for service Nottingham City NHS

1 message

Humanmeduk <logistic@humanmeduk.com> 2 September 2021 at 07:02

To: Kate Giriffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <tom@humanmeduk.com>

Date: Wed, 1 Sept 2021 at 17:48

Subject: Invoice for service Nottingham City NHS
To: <logistic@humanmeduk.com>

Hi

Please can we invoice Nottingham for routine service as per the attached PO. The order number for the routine
service is 112074.

Thanks

Tom
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