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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Order
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 1 September 2021 at 10:41
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ian Saunders <ian@cryoaction.com>

Date: Wed, 1 Sept 2021 at 10:40

Subject: Re: Order

To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>


Hello Sophie,

Hope you are well?


Please can I order 12 x KE-25 sensors. If you can send me a proforma invoice, I will arrange for immediate
payment?

Also, please can I order 2 x MAX-14 (0110466)so we can test their resistance values for compatibility with our
systems?


Best regards


Ian


Ian Saunders
Chief Executive Officer

           


T:  +44 (0) 203 827 6817
M: +44 (0) 793 156 2493
E: ian@cryoaction.com
W: www.cryoaction.com

The information in this email is confidential and solely for the use of the intended recipient(s). If you receive this email in error, please notify
the sender and delete the email from your system immediately. In such circumstances, you must not make any use of the email or its
contents.

Views expressed by an individual in this email do not necessarily reflect the views of CryoAction Limited.

Computer viruses may be transmitted by email. CryoAction Limited accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by
this email. E-mail transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free. It is possible that information may be intercepted, corrupted,
lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of
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On Tue, 18 May 2021 at 10:50, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Dear Ian, 


Thank you for your email. 


I can confirm the price for the KE-25 (unterminated - part number 0110524) is £49.60 each (excluding VAT) and
delivery would be free of charge. We have these available in stock. *Please note, our system states that this
sensor is not approved as a medical product, and is only suitable for non-medical applications.


You may be interested in a CE marked alternative - the MAX-14 (0110466) at £78.40 each - however, these are
not a standard stocked item and there would be a lead time of approximately 4-6 week for this sensor.


If you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact me. 

Kind regards



Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.


http://www.viamed.co.uk

Emailsophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: Search for Viamed Ltd



Company registered in England, No. 01291765.



E-mail Disclaimer

-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is prohibited
and may be unlawful.



If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject line or call
+44 (0)1535 634542

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------






On Tue, May 18, 2021 at 10:00 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:






---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Ian Saunders <ian@cryoaction.com>

Date: Tue, 18 May 2021 at 09:58

Subject: Fwd: Order

To: Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk>





Please can I arrange an order for 12  x GS Yuasa Oxygen Sensor KE-25 - Unterminated. Can you let me know
the price please and I will forward a purchase order for your attention?




Best regards



Ian



Ian Saunders
Chief Executive Officer
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The information in this email is confidential and solely for the use of the intended recipient(s). If you receive this email in error, please
notify the sender and delete the email from your system immediately. In such circumstances, you must not make any use of the email
or its contents.

Views expressed by an individual in this email do not necessarily reflect the views of CryoAction Limited.

Computer viruses may be transmitted by email. CryoAction Limited accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus transmitted
by this email. E-mail transmission cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free. It is possible that information may be intercepted,
corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions
in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-mail transmission.
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