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M Gma” Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>
Pro-forma invoice VPRO11160 dated 22.10.2019

4 messages

Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk> 22 October 2019 at 10:28

Reply-To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
To: guillaume@tekplongee.fr
Bcc: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Good morning Guillaume Genibrel,

Thank you very much for your order.

Please find attached your pro-forma invoice VPRO11160 dated 22.10.2019 for your approval and payment.
Please check that all the details are correct, including delivery address.

Our payment details are on the bottom of the invoice, or if you prefer you can call the office on +44 01535 634900 with
credit card details.

Once payment is received, we can then ship your order.
Kind regards

Gail Bell
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900

ﬂ tek-plongee.pdf
57K

Guillaume / TEK PLONGEE <guillaume@tekplongee.fr> 22 October 2019 at 12:53

To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk

Hello,
Thank you for your Pro Forma Invoice.
All is correct !

You will find attached the copy of bank transfer confirmation operated today. You should receive the money before the
end of the week !
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Best Regards

Guillaume GENIBREL

guillaume@tekplongee.fr

Tek Plongée

1 rue du Benelux

44300 NANTES - FRANCE
Tel: (+33) 02 40 35 24 65

Standard téléphonique ouvert du lundi au vendredi de 9h00 a 12h30 et de 14h00 a 17h30

www.tekplongee.fr

TEKroe:

@

Importation et distribution pour la France des marques Analox, Coltri compresseurs, I-Divesite, I-Torch, lkelite,
carbondive, ISC, OMS, Custom Divers, SpareAir ...

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Gail Bell
Envoyé : mardi 22 octobre 2019 11:28

A : guillaume@tekplongee.fr

Objet : Pro-forma invoice VPRO11160 dated 22.10.2019

[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ Wire transfer 191022.pdf
11K

Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk> 22 October 2019 at 14:13

Reply-To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Guillaume / TEK PLONGEE <guillaume@tekplongee.fr>
Bcc: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Good afternoon Guillaume,

Thank you very much for your email and confirmation of payment.

We have now shipped your order. Tracking number by UPS AWB: 1Z8W47826891989534.
Kind regards

Gail Bell
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk/
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Email gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Company registered in England, No. 02332105.

E-mail Disclaimer

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634900

[Quoted text hidden]

Guillaume / TEK PLONGEE <guillaume@tekplongee.fr> 20 August 2021 at 07:56
To: gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk
Dear Gail,

Can you send me a Pro Forma invoice for the supply of:

10/ 0110217 R17-VAN sensors

Kind Regards,

Guillaume GENIBREL

guillaume@tekplongee.fr

SAS TEK PLONGEE
ZI de la Croix Rouge
11 bis rue de I'Europe

44260 MALVILLE - FRANCE

IMPORTANT : depuis le 29 mars 2021, nous sommes définitivement installés
dans nos nouveaux locaux situés 11 Bis rue de I’Europe — ZI de la Croix Rouge
— 44260 MALVILLE - France.

Merci de prendre en compte cette nouvelle adresse dans votre logiciel de
gestion et dans les différents carnets d’adresses de vos opérateurs de
transport (Colissimo, DHL, GLS, UPS ...).

Groupe TEK CONCEPT DISTRIBUTION
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Tel: (+33) 02 40 35 24 65

Standard téléphonique ouvert du lundi au jeudi de 9h00 a 12h00 et de 14h00 a 17h15 . Le vendredi de 9h00 a 12h00.

www.tekplongee.fr

TEKroe:

@)

Importation et distribution pour la France des marques Analox, Coltri compresseurs, |-Divesite, I-Torch, Ikelite,
carbondive, ISC, OMS, Custom Divers, SpareAir ...

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Gail Bell
Envoyé : mardi 22 octobre 2019 11:28

A : guillaume@tekplongee.fr

Objet : Pro-forma invoice VPRO11160 dated 22.10.2019

Good morning Guillaume Genibrel,

[Quoted text hidden]
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