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Gail Bell <viamed.gail.bell@gmail.com>

Fwd: Inquiry for Sensor
1 message

Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> 16 August 2021 at 09:35
Reply-To: ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
To: Gail Bell <gail.bell@vandagraph.co.uk>

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.
http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Griffin Vincent <griffin@chambersoceanics.com>

Date: Mon, 16 Aug 2021 at 08:48

Subject: RE: Inquiry for Sensor

To: <ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk>

Cc: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>, Sheldon D'Lima <Sheldon@chambersoceanics.com>, John D'Lima
<john@chambersoceanics.com>


Hi Ryan,

 

Good day

 

May I please place an order for the below unit,

shipping and invoice will be to my UK office.

 

 

2 X R-17VAN sensors

 

 

 

 

Should you need any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

 

Griffin Vincent


T: +971 4 5800112

M: +971 55 6999137

E: griffin@chambersoceanics.
com


Chambers Oceanics FZC
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W360 Dubai Maritime City, Near
Dubai Drydocks Dubai, UAE

    www.chambersoceanics.com

“Service Facility Now Operational In DUBAI MARITIME CITY”

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Ryan Swaine

Sent: Friday, 13 August 2021 5:30 PM

To: Griffin Vincent <griffin@chambersoceanics.com>

Cc: Michael Lamb <michael.lamb@vandagraph.co.uk>

Subject: Re: Inquiry for Sensor

 

Hi Griffin

 

Thank you very much for your email.

 

The trade price is £35 each

Postage £6

 

Total with VAT = £91.20

 

The R-17VAN sensors are available from stock.

 

Best regards

Ryan

 

 

 

Ryan Swaine

VANDAGRAPH Ltd.

http://www.vandagraph.co.uk

Email ryan.swaine@vandagraph.co.uk
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Tel: +44 (0)1535 634900

Mob: +44 (0)7803 907117

 

 

On Fri, 13 Aug 2021 at 13:37, Griffin Vincent <griffin@chambersoceanics.com> wrote:

Hi Ryan,

 

Good day

 

Could you please advise cost and availability for the below

Attached pic for your reff.

 

Material / Service Description Code/Part # Quantity

Vandagraph Oxygen Sensor R-17VAN 2

 

 

 

 

 

Should you need any further information, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

 

Griffin Vincent



T: +971 4 5800112

M: +971 55 6999137

E: griffin@chambersoceanics.
com



Chambers Oceanics FZC

W360 Dubai Maritime City, Near
Dubai Drydocks Dubai, UAE

    www.chambersoceanics.com

“Service Facility Now Operational In DUBAI MARITIME CITY”
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