M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: R-23V Oxygen Sensor

1 message

abduladim Sufrani <alsofrani@hotmail.com> 10 August 2021 at 18:24
To: "ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk" <ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk>

Dear Ryan
Sorry for delayed reply

Please add 10 pcs flow sensor comparable with darger Evita ventilator

invoice address to

Balsamine medical company
21 abubakr asadik st Ben ashour area. Tripoli Libya

Att Mr Abduladim Sufrani
Tel 00218945239282

Delivery address is the same in Libya

TiP number is my account number at Aramex shop and ship service
Where they use the local address | s Nd to you to deliver the goods

if you can't use this address | can send you my DHL Account number

For any further information please contact me

Abduladim Sufrani
00218945239282

Get Outlook for Android

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Friday, August 6, 2021 5:41:52 PM

To: abduladim Sufrani <alsofrani@hotmail.com>

Subject: Re: R-23V Oxygen Sensor

Dear Abduladim

Is the TIP number your account number with Aramex?
I will need your complete delivery and invoice address for your invoice?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Fri, 6 Aug 2021 at 16:27, abduladim Sufrani <alsofrani@hotmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan

Thank you for your kind reply

Please note the Aramex address and Tip number that you can use for shipping

Mjdi W M Jaber

Aramex UK, Galleymead Rd Colnbrook
TIP 184264

Slough

Berkshire

SL3 OEN

United Kingdom

01753-210399

Please send me invoice with 30 pcs sensors
Best regards

Abduladim Sufrani
00218945239282

Get Outlook for Android

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> on behalf of Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk>
Sent: Friday, August 6, 2021 10:59:59 AM

To: alsofrani@hotmail.com <alsofrani@hotmail.com>

Subject: R-23V Oxygen Sensor

Dear Abduladim Sufrani
Thank you very much for your enquiry.
We would be happy to supply you with the R-23V O2 sensors at our distributor pricing:

R-23V - part no. 0110023 = GBP £28 / USD $43.75/ EUR €35
Price for each piece EXW

I can look into shipping costs for you, but | will require your complete delivery address and company details? We
have had some trouble organising this for Libya in the past, do you have an account with Aramex or another courier
that can be used for shipping?

I am not up to date with the current political climate in Libya, but we have had warnings in the past from our bank
that some payments could be stopped, | believe the last order we sent to Libya was actually paid from a different
country and delivered to a different country.

I look forward to your reply and please let me know if you have any questions.

Kind regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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