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Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

Re: Pls send the proforma Invoice New Quote Newport Sensor SEN2103P

1 message

Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> 10 August 2021 at 13:21
Reply-To: sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
To: Enrique Hernandez <HernandezEnrique@live.com>

Hi Enrique, 

My apologies, I could not see where you specified you would like 10 pcs, I will amend the Proforma ASAP and get
back to you - please do not make a payment until I have sent the correct document. 


Kind regards


Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
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On Tue, Aug 10, 2021 at 12:34 PM Enrique Hernandez <HernandezEnrique@live.com> wrote:

Hello. Sophie. 


You only quote 1 unit and we need 10. Pls update the quote. 


Regards,


Enrique 



El 10 ago. 2021, a la(s) 04:41, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> escribió:




﻿
Dear Enrique, 


Thank you for your email. 
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Please find attached your Proforma Invoice for 1x MAX-250E Oxygen Sensor for payment via
PayPal - I have used the same address details as your previous order - please check these and
advise if any changes are required?


Kind regards



Sophie Lines

Please note: My working days are Monday, Tuesday and Friday 9.30am-3.00pm

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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On Mon, Aug 9, 2021 at 6:10 PM Enrique Hernandez <HernandezEnrique@live.com> wrote:


Hello. Sophie. 



Pls. Send the Proforma Invoice. 



And PayPal account to pay you. 



Regards,



Enrique 



> El 6 ago. 2021, a la(s) 07:10, Sophie Lines <office@viamed.co.uk> escribió:

> 

> sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk
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