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Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>

RE: Purchase Order 280158161

1 message

Tilley, Amanda <Amanda.Tilley@southernhealth.nhs.uk> 10 August 2021 at 11:38
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Hi Zoey

 

Thanks for the email, we pay all delivery costs but only put them on the order if they are £40 and over

 

Kind regards

 

Amanda

 

Amanda Tilley
Operational Buyer

Southern Health NHS Foundation Trust

Procurement, The Elms, Tatchbury Mount

Calmore, Southampton SO40 2RZ

Tel: 02382311452

Email:
amanda.tilley@southernhealth.nhs.uk

Web:  
www.southernhealth.nhs.uk

 

P
Save a tree...please don't print this e-mail unless you really need to

 

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com>
On Behalf Of Zoey Teal

Sent: 10 August 2021 11:32

To: Tilley, Amanda <Amanda.Tilley@southernhealth.nhs.uk>

Subject: Purchase Order 280158161

 

mailto:amanda.tilley@southernhealth.nhs.uk
http://www.southernhealth.nhs.uk/
http://www.southernhealth.nhs.uk/knowledge/procurement/
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
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You don't often get email from
office@viamed.co.uk. Learn why this is important

##########################################################################################
###############################################

## CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the Trust. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognise the sender and know the content is safe. ##

##########################################################################################
###############################################

Good morning Amanda, 

 

Thank you for your order. 

 

I am writing to advise you that there is a carriage charge of £10.00 required for this order. Please can you confirm if
you are happy to proceed?

 

Please note the lead time is going to be approximately 2-3 weeks. 


 

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

 

Kind regards

 

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email:
viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

 

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 

 

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

 

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

 

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at
www.viamed.co.uk/policy 
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-----------------

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken
in reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

 

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

-----------------

 

 

On Tue, Aug 10, 2021 at 10:45 AM Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <shared.services@nhs.net>

Date: Tue, 10 Aug 2021 at 10:43

Subject: Important NHS Purchase Order Documentation No: 280158161 (please do not reply to this address)

To: <INFO@viamed.co.uk>









Message from NHS Shared Business Services

mailto:office@viamed.co.uk
mailto:shared.services@nhs.net
mailto:INFO@viamed.co.uk

