06/08/2021 Gmail - Fwd: [External]: URGENT - Quote request

M Gma" Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: [External]: URGENT - Quote request

1 message

Sarah Walton <office@viamed.co.uk> Fri, Aug 6, 2021 at 9:04 AM

Reply-To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
To: sophie.lines@vmsecure.me.uk

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com>
Date: Fri, 6 Aug 2021 at 08:35

Subject: RE: [External]: URGENT - Quote request

To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Zoey,

Sorry, but the last picture sent was not the right one.

We need 3 mainstream ref VM-2500-M with the Lingual Sensor Part Number: 0015000

The ultra-compact, ergonomic design of the

VM-2500 combines outstanding performance
and reliability in for either mainstream or
sidestream CO, and SpO, monitoring.

Mainstream Standard Package

Mainstream Unit

IRMA™ CO, analyser

IRMA™ Airway adapter (Small and Large)
Reusable SpO, sensor

USB data cable

Power supply (EU and UK Plug)
4 x AA batteries

1 x Li-Poly battery (CT-2500)
Silicone protective cover

PC software

Instruction manual on CD

* Please select either Lingual Sensor or Multi-site Y Sensor, and
Indicate at the time of ordefing

Our address is (deliveries and invoices :
Charles River Laboratories France Safety Assessment
329 Imp. Du domaine Rozier, Les Oncins

69210 Saint Germain Nuelles - France

N° TVA CEE : FR 17323840645

N° EORI : FR32384064500028

Could you please send me the quotation this morning ?

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1707330344988167568%7Cmsg-f%3A170733034...
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Thanks in advance.

Best regards,

Marion RAMPONT

Acheteur - Buyer | Global Procurement Supply Chain Operations
Charles River Laboratories France Safety Assessment

329 Imp. Du domaine Rozier, Les Oncins

69210 Saint Germain Nuelles - France

P: +33 (0)4 74 72 29 56

marion.rampont@crl.com| www.criver.com

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Zoey Teal
Envoyé : jeudi 5 ao(t 2021 18:55

A : Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com>

Objet : Re: [External]: URGENT - Quote request

Dear Marion,

Thank you for your reply.

Your original enquiry was for the Mainstream but your attachment shows the Sidestream. Please can you confirm which require?

| can confirm that we do get everything listed in each package.

If you require an official quotation, please can you confirm your full invoice and delivery address and also your VAT number?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up
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Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it, is
prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the subject
line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, Aug 5, 2021 at 2:29 PM Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com> wrote:

Dear Zoey,
Thank you for your quick reply.

Could you please confirm that the price of 2390 € includes all the items below ?

Sidestream Standard Package

Sidestream Unit

1 x VersaStream Large/Small Airway Adapter
Sampling Line - Short Term

1 x VersaStream Large/Small Airway Adapter
Sampling Line - Long Term

1 x VersaStream Sampling Line with Luer Lock
Connector - Long Term

Reusable SpQ, sensor*

USE data cable

Power supply (UK and EU Plug)

4 x AA batteries

1 x Li-Poly battery (CT-2500)

Silicone protective cover

PC software

Instruction manual on CD

Airway Adapter
Sampling Line

* Please select either Lingual Sensor or Multi-site Y Sensor, and
indicate at the time of ordering

Sampling Line with
Luer Lock Connector
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We need the Lingual Sensor Part Number: 0015000

Please send me back your best offer (pdf version) for 3 Veterinary Capnograph VM-2500-M (complete).

Thanks in advance.

Kind regards,

Marion RAMPONT

Acheteur - Buyer | Global Procurement Supply Chain Operations
Charles River Laboratories France Safety Assessment

329 Imp. Du domaine Rozier, Les Oncins

69210 Saint Germain Nuelles - France

P: +33 (0)4 74 72 29 56

marion.rampont@crl.com| www.criver.com

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Zoey Teal
Envoyé : jeudi 5 ao(it 2021 12:41

A : Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com>

Objet : Re: [External]: URGENT - Quote request

Dear Marion,

Please find the completed attachment attached.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
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Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on it,
is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Thu, Aug 5, 2021 at 8:36 AM Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com> wrote:

Dear Zoey,

Thanks for your reply.

Could you please send me the completed attachment and your bank details (RIB) so that we can create your supplier account ?

Thank you in advance.

Sincerely,

Marion RAMPONT

Acheteur - Buyer | Global Procurement Supply Chain Operations
Charles River Laboratories France Safety Assessment

329 Imp. Du domaine Rozier, Les Oncins

69210 Saint Germain Nuelles - France

P: +33 (0)4 74 72 29 56

marion.rampont@crl.com| www.criver.com

De : Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> De la part de Zoey Teal
Envoyé : mercredi 4 aott 2021 18:03

A : Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com>

Objet : Re: [External]: URGENT - Quote request

Dear Marion,
Thank you for your reply.

The price of the Veterinary Capnograph is €2390.00 each.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1707330344988167568%7Cmsg-f%3A170733034...  5/9


https://nam12.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Ffacebook.com%2FViamedLtdUK&data=04%7C01%7Cmarion.rampont%40crl.com%7Cae0bb9585cf6478a487908d9583a05c0%7C374f8930e1504031bb35483215fe5900%7C0%7C0%7C637637828648670945%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=JmycC529XYlnbhGdyXyiTRWuCS6PLFfNXdYVc4GwI5A%3D&reserved=0
https://nam12.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.viamed.co.uk%2Fpolicy&data=04%7C01%7Cmarion.rampont%40crl.com%7Cae0bb9585cf6478a487908d9583a05c0%7C374f8930e1504031bb35483215fe5900%7C0%7C0%7C637637828648680898%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=LvnY%2F5IOulIPNW%2Be8%2BQUfeVzLmZXURVBgGhE0X4ZFgM%3D&reserved=0
mailto:Marion.Rampont@crl.com
mailto:marion.rampont@crl.com%7C
https://nam12.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.criver.com%2F&data=04%7C01%7Cmarion.rampont%40crl.com%7Cae0bb9585cf6478a487908d9583a05c0%7C374f8930e1504031bb35483215fe5900%7C0%7C0%7C637637828648680898%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=66Op3xjSRD03xSuynIvD9nfUhNGloWOnHw4PKmS0yKg%3D&reserved=0
mailto:viamedinbox@gmail.com
mailto:Marion.Rampont@crl.com

06/08/2021 Gmail - Fwd: [External]: URGENT - Quote request

The lead time would be approximately 3-5 weeks from the date of payment being received.

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.
http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.

It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance on
it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

On Wed, Aug 4, 2021 at 4:57 PM Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com> wrote:
Dear Zoey,
Could you please send me your best offer for 1 VIAMED VM-2500-M and let me know the delivery time ?
Thanks in advance.

Regards,

Marion RAMPONT

Acheteur - Buyer | Global Procurement Supply Chain Operations
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Charles River Laboratories France Safety Assessment
329 Imp. Du domaine Rozier, Les Oncins

69210 Saint Germain Nuelles - France

P: +33 (0)4 74 72 29 56

marion.rampont@crl.com| www.criver.com

De : Rampont, Marion

Envoyé : mardi 3 aolt 2021 18:14

A : zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Objet : RE: [External]: URGENT - Quote request

Dear Zoey,

It's for our own use.

Best regards,

Marion RAMPONT

Acheteur - Buyer | Global Procurement Supply Chain Operations
Charles River Laboratories France Safety Assessment

329 Imp. Du domaine Rozier, Les Oncins

69210 Saint Germain Nuelles - France

P: +33 (0)4 74 72 29 56

marion.rampont@crl.com| www.criver.com

De : Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>
Envoyé : mardi 3 ao(t 2021 16:42

A : Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com>
Objet : [External]: URGENT - Quote request

Dear Marion,

Thank you for your email.

Please may | ask if the Capnograph would be for your own use or for re-sale?

If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Kind regards

Zoey Teal
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http://www.viamed.co.uk

Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk

Alternate email: zoey.teal@viamed.me.uk
Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542

Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in reliance
on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete in the
subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

From: Rampont, Marion <Marion.Rampont@crl.com>
Date: Tue, 3 Aug 2021 at 13:58

Subject: URGENT - Quote request

To: sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>

Hello,

We need to order 1

Part number 4410530
Product name : VYM-2500-M Mainstream Capnograph (Veterinary)
GTIN/EAN13 5051826003282

Could you please send me your best offer for 1 VIAMED VM-2500-M and let me know the delivery time?

Thanks in advance.

Kind regards,
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=d104de5290&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1707330344988167568%7Cmsg-f%3A170733034...  8/9
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Marion RAMPONT

Acheteur - Buyer | Global Procurement Supply Chain Operations
Charles River Laboratories France Safety Assessment

329 Imp. Du domaine Rozier, Les Oncins

69210 Saint Germain Nuelles - France

P: +33 (0)4 74 72 29 56

marion.rampont@crl.com| www.criver.com
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