06/08/2021 Gmail - RE: FW: Fresh PO

M Gma || Sarah Walton <viamed.sarah.walton@gmail.com>

RE: FW: Fresh PO

1 message
info@headingtonmedical.co.uk <info@headingtonmedical.co.uk> 6 August 2021 at 12:40
To: sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

Cc: customersupport@hindustan-medical.com, ajay@hindustan-medical.com, Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>,
Subhasis Mukherjee <subhasis.mukherjee@pentafreight.com>

Dear Sarah,
Thank you.

Please note the forwarder details,

European Freight Limited
Unit 5, Building X2
Eastern Perimeter Road
London Heathrow Airport
Hatton Cross

TW6 2GE

Please share the packing details once the goods are packed which will enable us to negotiate with the forwarder.

Best Regards

Sanjay

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sarah Walton

Sent: 06 August 2021 10:27

To: info@headingtonmedical.co.uk

Cc: customersupport@hindustan-medical.com; ajay@hindustan-medical.com; Kate Griffitths
<kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Subject: Re: FW: Fresh PO

Dear Sanjay,
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Thank you for your payment.

Please can you advise me which courier company you will be using for this shipment so that | can add this information to
your order?

Once your order has been packed and we have a copy of the picking list and invoice, we will let you know.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton
Customer Service Representative
Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@yviamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.
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If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with delete
in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <info@headingtonmedical.co.uk>

Date: Thu, 5 Aug 2021 at 12:33

Subject: FW: Fresh PO

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Customer Support <customersupport@hindustan-medical.com>, <ajay@hindustan-medical.com>

Dear Sarah,

Thank you for the PI. Please find the payment receipt from our bank.

Can you please acknowledge the payment and arrange to send us the invoice and packing details.

Thank you,
Best Regards,

Sanjay

From: Main Account <viamedinbox@gmail.com> On Behalf Of Sarah Walton
Sent: 03 August 2021 08:37

To: info@headingtonmedical.co.uk

Cc: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Subject: Re: Fresh PO

Dear Sanjay,

Kate is on annual leave so please accept my reply.

Please find attached a proforma invoice for the 100 x flow sensors.

Kind regards

Sarah Walton

Customer Service Representative

Please note: We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be
answered.
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Our office opening hours are Monday - Friday 8.30am - 5.30pm.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

Tel: +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up

Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd

Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.

If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <info@headingtonmedical.co.uk>
Date: Mon, 2 Aug 2021 at 19:36
Subject: Fresh PO

To: <kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk>

Dear Kate,

Hope you are doing well and in good health.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=97 ca69e8f6 &view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1707058495706000794%7Cmsg-f%3A17073400917973... 4/5


http://www.viamed.co.uk/
mailto:sarah.walton@viamed.co.uk
http://www.viamed.co.uk/policy
http://www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up
http://twitter.com/ViamedLtd
http://facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK
mailto:info@headingtonmedical.co.uk
mailto:kate.griffiths@viamed.co.uk

06/08/2021 Gmail - RE: FW: Fresh PO

Can you please send me the PI for the 100 boxes of 4310003 (SpiroTrue) Flow sensor. Pack of 6.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sanjay
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