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Zoey Teal <viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com>

Fwd: CUH - Viamed - Neonatal Phototherapy Goggles

7 messages

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Aug 4, 2021 at 8:56 AM
To: Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Cooper, Matthew <matthew.cooper@addenbrookes.nhs.uk>

Date: Wed, 4 Aug 2021 at 08:31

Subject: CUH - Viamed - Neonatal Phototherapy Goggles

To: keith.taylor@viamed.co.uk <keith.taylor@viamed.co.uk>, sales@viamed.co.uk <sales@viamed.co.uk>


Morning Keith,

 

I work in the sourcing team at Addenbrookes Hospital, Cambridge. I understand that one of my clinicians from our
Neonatal Intensive Care Unit has been in touch, either with yourself or a colleague, around phototherapy goggles that
Viamed
offer.

 

We are interest in acquiring a few further samples, to evaluate on patients, so clinical samples opposed to table-top.
Alongside this could I also ask for a quotation please?

 

Kind Regards,

 

Matthew Cooper
| Procurement Manager

Mobile 07598 404 043

Office landline 01223 348 671 |
www.cuh.org.uk

 

Strategic Sourcing
| Procurement | Box 200

Cambridge University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust


Cambridge Biomedical Campus | Hills Road | Cambridge | CB2 0QQ

The Trust is:
part of the National Institute for Health Research - Cambridge Biomedical Research Centre | and a
member of Cambridge University Health Partners

This email is confidential,
see www.cuh.org.uk/email_disclaimer.html

 

Planned Leave: Friday
3rd September 2021 to Friday 10th September 2021 (Inclusive)

 

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Aug 4, 2021 at 1:26 PM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: matthew.cooper@addenbrookes.nhs.uk

Good afternoon Matthew, 
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Thank you for your email. 

We supply three sizes of the Eyemax. Regular, premie and micro. We can send you a sample of each size.

1114005 (regular) = £42.50 per pack of 20.

1114006 (premie) = £40.75 per pack of 20.

1114007 (micro) = £36.75 per pack of 20.

Please can you confirm the invoice and delivery address for your order?

Last week we also sent a sample pack out to Paula Weaver at The Rosie Hospital. 

Please note that Keith left Viamed 5 years ago now. 


If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.


Kind regards


Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 


Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------

[Quoted text hidden]

Cooper, Matthew <matthew.cooper@addenbrookes.nhs.uk> Wed, Aug 4, 2021 at 1:40 PM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Thanks Zoe,

 

Apologies I was simply looking at a rollerdex – I shall discard his card.

 

I believe Paula passed them on to the clinician; the clinician is now hoping for a few more to try on a small section
of patients,
to ensure they do indeed meet expectations. Is it possible to perhaps get 2 or 3 of each size?
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Kind Regards,

 

Matthew Cooper
| Procurement Manager

Mobile 07598 404 043

Office landline 01223 348 671 |
www.cuh.org.uk

 

Strategic Sourcing
| Procurement | Box 200

Cambridge University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust


Cambridge Biomedical Campus | Hills Road | Cambridge | CB2 0QQ

The Trust is: part
of the National Institute for Health Research - Cambridge Biomedical Research Centre | and a
member of Cambridge University Health Partners

This email is confidential, see
www.cuh.org.uk/email_disclaimer.html

 

Planned Leave: Friday 3rd September 2021 to Friday 10th
September 2021 (Inclusive)

 

[Quoted text hidden]

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Wed, Aug 4, 2021 at 5:25 PM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: "Cooper, Matthew" <matthew.cooper@addenbrookes.nhs.uk>

Hello Matthew, 

Thank you for your reply. 

We can send 3 samples of each size for you. 

Please can you confirm the invoice and delivery address for the order to be sent to?


If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.


Kind regards


Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 


Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------
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The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------


[Quoted text hidden]

Cooper, Matthew <matthew.cooper@addenbrookes.nhs.uk> Thu, Aug 5, 2021 at 8:25 AM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Thank you,

 

Samples can be sent –

 

FAO Matthew Cooper – Box 200

Procurement Goods-In

Addenbrookes Hospital

Hills Road

Cambridge

CB2 0QQ

 

Can I check the purpose of the invoice address please?

 

Kind Regards,

 

Matthew Cooper
| Procurement Manager

Mobile 07598 404 043

Office landline 01223 348 671 |
www.cuh.org.uk

 

Strategic Sourcing
| Procurement | Box 200

Cambridge University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust


Cambridge Biomedical Campus | Hills Road | Cambridge | CB2 0QQ

The Trust is: part
of the National Institute for Health Research - Cambridge Biomedical Research Centre | and a
member of Cambridge University Health Partners

This email is confidential, see
www.cuh.org.uk/email_disclaimer.html

 

Planned Leave: Friday 3rd September 2021 to Friday 10th
September 2021 (Inclusive)
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[Quoted text hidden]

Zoey Teal <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk> Thu, Aug 5, 2021 at 9:09 AM
Reply-To: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
To: "Cooper, Matthew" <matthew.cooper@addenbrookes.nhs.uk>

Hello Matthew, 

In order for us to issue the order that is even free of charge we would need an address as our systems do not allow
us to proceed without one.


If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact me.


Kind regards


Zoey Teal

Please note: My working days are Monday to Thursday, 7.45am-6.00pm.

We are currently working remotely however telephone calls to the main office will still be answered.

http://www.viamed.co.uk
Email: zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk
Alternate email: viamed.zoey.teal@gmail.com
Tel:  +44 (0)1535 634542
Fax: +44 (0)1535 635582

Sign up to our mailing list, go to www.viamed.co.uk/sign-up 


Twitter: twitter.com/ViamedLtd
Facebook Page: facebook.com/ViamedLtdUK

Company registered in England, No. 01291765.

E-mail Disclaimer
GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy 

-----------------
The information in this email is confidential and may be legally privileged.
It is intended solely for the addressee. Access to this email by anyone else is unauthorized.
If you are not the intended recipient, any disclosure, copying, distribution or any action taken or omitted to be taken in
reliance on it, is prohibited and may be unlawful.

If you feel you have received this email in error or would like to be removed from our mailing list, please reply with
delete in the subject line or call +44 (0)1535 634542
-----------------


[Quoted text hidden]

Cooper, Matthew <matthew.cooper@addenbrookes.nhs.uk> Thu, Aug 5, 2021 at 11:01 AM
To: "zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk" <zoey.teal@viamed.co.uk>

Thanks Zoe,

 

It is as follows:-

 

Accounts Payable, (Creditors) – Box 130

Cambridge University Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust,

Hills Road
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Cambridge

CB2 2QQ

 

creditors@addenbrookes.nhs.uk

[Quoted text hidden]
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