M Gma” Ryan Swaine <viamed.ryan.swaine@gmail.com>

Re: Max250E///200pcs

1 message

Trinh Phwong <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com> 4 August 2021 at 12:21
To: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk

Dear Ryan,

Well noted and waitting your further information.
Thanks.

Vao Th 4, 4 thg 8, 2021 Itc 18:17 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Dear Phoung,

We have some more stock that is currently allocated to other orders. We are going to speak with Maxtec this
evening and see what their lead time is. If they have stock they can send straight away, it may be possible for us to
utilise the reserved stock and supply the 220x in a single shipment from stock for you.

| will be in contact tomorrow morning.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@yviamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 4 Aug 2021 at 11:58, Trinh Phwong <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

Yes. | need CO. If you can do 1 CO for 220pcs, pls do it. If not, you can do 2 CO for each PI.

Vao Th 4, 4 thg 8, 2021 Itc 17:56 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Dear Phoung

Thank you very much, will you need a Certificate of Origin on each of the PI1?

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Wed, 4 Aug 2021 at 11:18, Trinh Phwong <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,
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| want to order 220pcs MAX250E. Should we make 2 PI for all?

TRINH PHUONG

DT: 0987 546 072

CONG TY TNHH SX TM XNK AN AN

D/C: 497/123/14 THONG NHAT, P.16, Q.GO VAP, TP.HCM

Vao Th 5, 29 thg 7, 2021 vao lic 17:10 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> da viét:
Dear Phuong

Thank you very much.

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy

On Thu, 29 Jul 2021 at 10:59, Trinh Phwong <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

R-22AVG is suitable with us. | will make order for both soon.

Vao Th 5, 29 thg 7, 2021 lic 16:08 Ryan Swaine <office@viamed.co.uk> d3 viét:
Dear Phuong

Thank you for your email.

We can have 100x Max250E ready straight from stock, the second 100 we can have available in 2-3
weeks.

The AO2 sensor in your picture is not for medical use, it is for automotive or industrial applications. |
am pleased to inform you that we have two models available that would be a suitable replacement:

Viamed R-22AVG (part no. 0110182)

1=% 10+ =$ 27.80 25+ =$25.90 50+ =$ 24.30 100+ = $ 22.90
29.90 each each each each

100+ available from stock

Teledyne R-22AV (part no. 0110132)

1=% 10+ =$28.20 25+ =$26.30 50+ =$24.70 100+ = $ 23.20
32.90 each each each each

200+ available from stock

Best regards
Ryan

Ryan Swaine

International Sales Manager
VIAMED

www.viamed.co.uk

Email: ryan.swaine@viamed.co.uk
Office: +44 (0) 1535 634542
Mobile: +44 (0) 7803 907117

GDPR / Privacy Policy available at www.viamed.co.uk/policy
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On Thu, 29 Jul 2021 at 07:23, Trinh Phwong <trinhphuong2606@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Ryan,

| have plan to order 200pcs of Max250E next week. If you don’t have 200pcs in stock, | will make 2
orders, 100pcs per each oders. Please advise me when you will delivery goods for each order.

Do you have AO2 sensor ( as attached picture)? If yes, pls give me price.

Thank you,
Phuong.
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