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Sophie Lines <viamed.sophie.lines@gmail.com>

Fwd: Telephone order - No1 Calibrations

1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> Fri, Jul 30, 2021 at 6:33 PM
To: Sophie Lines <sophie.lines@viamed.co.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Steve Hardaker <office@viamed.co.uk>

Date: Fri, 30 Jul 2021 at 15:45

Subject: Telephone order - No1 Calibrations

To: <sales@viamed.co.uk>


Hi, 


Please can someone process the attached telephone order for No1 Calibrations. 


Sandy Gough advised that they pay by proforma invoice, please send to no1calibrations@gmail.com thanks.

Steve H
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