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Kate Griffiths <viamed.kate.griffiths@gmail.com>

Fwd: Nuffield Jesmond
1 message

Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> 28 July 2021 at 14:41
To: Kate Griffitths <kate.griffiths@vmsecure.me.uk>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Matthias Borgert <matthias@humanmeduk.com>

Date: Wed, 28 Jul 2021 at 14:39

Subject: Re: Nuffield Jesmond

To: Griffiths Kate <office@viamed.co.uk>

Cc: Ladds Tom <tom@humanmeduk.com>


Hi Kate,

Goods have been directly sent from Germany already, as we haven’t had them on stock in the UK and they need
them urgent.

Please use the usual prices from the system.

Best regards,
Matthias


On 28 Jul 2021, at 13:45, Main Account <office@viamed.co.uk> wrote:

Hi Matthias,

Thank you for your email.

Please could you confirm if this is to go on as an order for invoicing only - no goods to be sent?  If so,
are we using the usual prices from our system?

Many thanks.

Kate Griffiths

On Wed, 28 Jul 2021 at 13:12, Matthias Borgert <matthias@humanmeduk.com> wrote:

Hi Team viamed,



Can you please invoice the attached delivery note to the Nuffield Jesmond.



Thank you.



Best regards,

Matthias
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